CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Uniform Rental Services
Bid No: RFP 2010-003
Date: February 2, 2010 2:00 p.m.
G & K Services UniFirst Aramark Uniform NAFECO
ITEM QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDEQ UNIT EXTENDED
Uniform Rental
1 5| emplyr [Airport Shirt per attached bid specifications 83.20 416.00 91.52 457.60 No Bid No Bid
2 5| emplyr [Airport Cargo Pants per attached bid specifications 156.00 780.00 143.00 715.00 No Bid No Bid
3 9 empl/yr |Animal Control Shirt per attached bid specifications 132.08 1,188.72 125.84 1,132.56 No Bid No Bid
4 9| emplyr [Animal Control Cargo Pants per attached bid specifications 156.00 1,404.00 143.00 1,287.00 No Bid No Bid
5 3| emplyr [Arts Center Shirt per attached bid specifications 83.20 249.60 91.52 274.56 No Bid No Bid
6 3| empl/yr |Arts Center Trouser per attached bid specifications 83.20 249.60 91.52 274.56 No Bid No Bid
7 23| emplyr |Executive Shirt per attached bid specificaations 124.80 2,870.40 114.40 2,631.20 No Bid No Bid
8 23| empl/yr |Executive Trouser per attached bid specifications 124.80 2,870.40 143.00 3,289.00 No Bid No Bid
9 228| emplyr [Industrial Shirt per attached bid specifications 83.20 18,969.60 91.52 | 20,866.56 No Bid No Bid
10 228| emplyr [Industrial Trouser per attached bid specifications 83.20 18,969.60 91.52 20,866.56 No Bid
11 18| emplyr |Parks Services Shorts per attached bid specifications 83.20 1,497.60 91.52 1,647.36 No Bid No Bid
12 8| emplyr [Utilities Shorts per attached bid specifications 83.20 665.60 91.52 732.16 No Bid No Bid
Uniform Rental Total 50,131.12 54,174.12 No Bid No Bid
Mats, Mops and Towels
1 50 wk Walk-off mats 3' x 4' 54.00 2,700.00 62.50 3,125.00 No Bid No Bid
2 50 wk Walk-off mats 4' x 6' 108.00 5,400.00 100.00 5,000.00 No Bid No Bid
3 5 wk Walk-off mats 3' x 10" 18.00 90.00 12.50 62.50 No Bid No Bid
4 10 wk Dust Control Mops 36" size 9.00 90.00 8.00 80.00 No Bid No Bid
5 10 wk Dust Control Mops 48" size 12.00 120.00 10.00 100.00 No Bid No Bid
6 50 wk Shop Towels 18" x 18" 2.00 57.60 3.00 150.00 No Bid No Bid
7 12 wk Fendor Covers 4.80 57.60 6.00 72.00 No Bid No Bid
Mats, Mops and Towels Total 8,515.20 8,589.50 No Bid No Bid
Awarded Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $ 58,646.32 $62,763.62
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $ 58,646.32 $62,763.62 [ NoBid [ NoBid
TERMS: Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
DELIVERY: As Stated As Stated
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