CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  May 4, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Blagg Tire & Service Wingfoot Commercial Tire
Southern Tire Mart, LLC (alternate 1) GCR Tire Centers Systems, LLC
ITEM QTY | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
12-16.5TR 001301 Bobcat Tire (Must be Non-Directional) City Number
1 12| ea [96-5-06000 99.00 1,188.00 129.95 1,559.40 354.87 4,258.44 166.80 2,001.60
P205-65SR15 Bridgestone 026-359, or approved equivalent City
2 8| ea [Number 96-5-06001 59.50 476.00 52.48 419.84 No Bid 60.45 483.60
LT215/85/R16 Firestone Transforce HT 187-701, or approved
3 24| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06002 83.35 2,000.40 83.64 2,007.36 90.25 2,166.00 104.36 2,504.64
P225/60VR16 Goodyear RSA V Rated 734-354-500, or approved
4 275| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06003 71.95 19,786.25 64.25 17,668.75 74.00 20,350.00 74.50 20,487.50
LT245/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler RSA 179-469-492, or approved
5 12| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06004 95.75 1,149.00 94.54 1,134.48 102.70 1,232.40 123.24 1,478.88
355/70D17.5 Firestone Duraforce 371-453 (No Substitutions) City
6 12| ea [Number 96-5-06006 232.00 2,784.00 333.00 3,996.00 303.23 3,638.76 No Bid
11L15 Carlisle/Firestone 326011 (Backhoe), or approved equivalent
7 8| ea |City Number 96-5-06007 158.00 1,264.00 144.28 1,154.24 147.40 1,179.20 90.79 726.32
P215/60R16 Firestone TR380 061-991, or approved equivalent City
8 8| ea [Number 96-5-06008 61.00 488.00 63.48 507.84 73.00 584.00 71.73 573.84
225/70R19.5 Bridgestone M724F 272-876 (No Substitutions) City
9 18| ea [Number 96-5-06009 177.00 3,186.00 179.59 3,232.62 176.00 3,168.00 No Bid
P235/75R16 BF Goodrich Long Trail #22027, or approved equivalent
10 8| ea |City Number 96-5-06010 81.30 650.40 82.44 659.52 91.00 728.00 95.78 766.24
P235/75R15 Bridgestone SE200 026-036, or approved equivalent City
11 4| ea [Number 96-5-06011 79.30 317.20 68.94 275.76 67.00 268.00 67.15 268.60
235/55R17 Firestone 077-325, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits 06 -08
12 134| ea |Crown Victoria City Number 96-5-06012 84.90 11,376.60 84.99 11,388.66 88.68 11,883.12 102.67 13,757.78
P225/60R18 Continental Contipro Contact 99V 1547465, or approved
13 145| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06014 92.00 13,340.00 92.75 13,448.75 99.75 14,463.75 112.00 16,240.00
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 183-601-418, or approved
14 18| ea [equivalent City Number 96-5-06015 84.30 1,517.40 86.98 1,565.64 89.00 1,602.00 95.48 1,718.64
4.80-4.00-8 Carlisle Turfsaver 511250, or approved equivalent City
15 6| ea |[Number 96-5-06016 17.25 103.50 20.22 121.32 18.99 113.94 18.40 110.40
23-10.50-12 Carlisle Turfsaver 511121, or approved equivalent City
16 2| ea |[Number 96-5-06017 41.50 83.00 75.99 151.98 67.00 134.00 35.88 71.76
16x6.50x8 Carlise Turfsaver 511401, or approved equivalent City
17 6| ea |[Number 96-5-06018 16.50 99.00 36.92 221.52 25.00 150.00 20.72 124.32
P225/70R15 Firestone Firehawk 067-938, or approved equivalent City
18 4| ea |Number 96-5-06020 70.00 280.00 69.99 279.96 71.00 284.00 74.00 296.00
GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  May 4, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Blagg Tire & Service Wingfoot Commercial Tire
Southern Tire Mart, LLC (alteranate 1) GCR Tire Centers Systems, LLC
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
P215/75R15 Goodyear 402-391-436, or approved equivalent City
19 10| ea [Number 96-5-06025 53.00 530.00 54.71 547.10 59.00 590.00 75.40 754.00
P215/60R15 Goodyear Eagle GT 94V 100-849-277, or approved
20 18| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06026 67.00 1,206.00 59.48 1,070.64 No Bid 58.70 1,056.60
LT235/85R16 Firestone Transforce HT 189-718, or approved
21 24| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06027 77.00 1,848.00 77.29 1,854.96 86.00 2,064.00 89.00 2,136.00
7.50R16 Hankook F19 2000863 Trailer Tire, or approved equivalent
22 12| ea |[City Number 96-5-06030 142.00 1,704.00 139.94 1,679.28 120.00 1,440.00 122.05 1,464.60
11R22.5 Highway Tire Firestone 156-558, or approved equivalent City
23 375 ea |Number 96-5-06032 223.00 83,625.00 208.49 78,183.75 232.60 87,225.00 269.01 100,878.75
P205/70R15 Goodyear Integrity 402-117-436, or approved equivalent
24 10| ea |[City Number 96-5-06035 56.00 560.00 54.10 541.00 56.00 560.00 59.51 595.10
LT225/75R16 Firestone Transforce 189-752, or approved equivalent
25 120| ea |City Number 96-5-06040 74.50 8,940.00 74.79 8,974.80 81.50 9,780.00 89.00 10,680.00
LT225/75R17 General Grabber AW 4569100000, or approved
26 8| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06045 90.50 724.00 94.15 753.20 No Bid No Bid
245/75R22.5 Goodyear G149 RSA (No Substitutions). Tire Fits 2010
27 32| ea |IHC Sideloader City Number 96-5-06105 218.00 6,976.00 219.99 7,039.68 No Bid 300.55 9,617.60
11R22.5 Mud Tire Firestone T831 281-557 (No Substitutions) City
28 126| ea |[Number 96-05-06110 252.00 31,752.00 229.15 28,872.90 263.00 33,138.00 381.26 48,038.76
LT245/75R16 Eagle Wrangler HT 748-747-188, or approved equivalent
29 100| ea |City Number 96-5-06115 77.80 7,780.00 77.74 7,774.00 95.00 9,500.00 136.66 13,666.00
LT245/75R17 Continental Contitrac 0432008 (No Substitutions). Tire
30 60| ea |Fits Ford Ambulance City Number 96-5-06120 157.00 9,420.00 95.60 5,736.00 153.00 9,180.00 No Bid
205/75R15 Goodyear Integrity, or approved equivalent City Number 96-
31 12| ea [5-06150 51.80 621.60 51.12 613.44 55.00 660.00 59.18 710.16
7.50x16 Firestone FR380 339-245, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
32 4| ea |Case Tractor City Number 96-5-06201 97.00 388.00 71.00 284.00 56.30 225.20 89.90 359.60
P205/75R14 Goodyear Integrity, or approved equivalent City Number
33 24| ea |96-5-06213 50.50 1,212.00 44.57 1,069.68 55.00 1,320.00 56.47 1,355.28
11L-16 Firestone F3 314-625, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits Ford
34 20| ea |Backhoes City Number 96-5-06216 93.50 1,870.00 133.98 2,679.60 140.00 2,800.00 133.55 2,671.00
9.50R16.5 Firestone 189-820, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
35 30| ea |Interstate Trailers City Number 96-5-06224 92.20 2,766.00 94.17 2,825.10 98.00 2,940.00 133.79 4,013.70
12R22.5 Bridgestone R250F 292-850, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
36 8| ea |Fire Truck City Number 96-5-06230 275.50 2,204.00 277.99 2,223.92 276.00 2,208.00 403.86 3,230.88

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  April 21, 2009 2:00 p.m.
Blagg Tire & Service Wingfoot Commercial Tire
Southern Tire Mart, LLC (alteranate 1) GCR Tire Centers Systems, LLC
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
11R22.5 Firestone R250ED 206-973, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
37 33| ea |Fire Truck City Number 96-5-06232 242.00 7,986.00 208.49 6,880.17 239.00 7,887.00 344.46 11,367.18
385/65R22.5 Firestone 839 Widebase 294-586, or approved equivalent
38 2| ea |City Number 96-5-06233 308.00 616.00 312.49 624.98 320.00 640.00 506.37 1,012.74
39 4| ea |20.5 E3/L3 20 Ply Non-Directional City Number 96-5-06234 690.00 2,760.00 814.95 3,259.80 | 1,090.00 4,360.00 751.20 3,004.80
315/80R22.5 Michelin XZA1 Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
40 12| ea [Truck City Number 96-5-06235 326.00 3,912.00 405.00 4,860.00 416.24 4,994.88 No Bid
425/65R22.5 Michelin XFE Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
41 8| ea |Truck City Number 96-5-06236 379.00 3,032.00 485.00 3,880.00 538.07 4,304.56 No Bid
385/65R22.5 Michelin XFE Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
42 8| ea |Truck City Number 96-5-06237 331.00 2,648.00 465.00 3,720.00 477.75 3,822.00 No Bid
43 4| ea [16-9-24 R-3 Turf Tire 6 Ply Diamond Tread City Number 96-5-06260 552.00 2,208.00 499.98 1,999.92 500.00 2,000.00 448.56 1,794.24
18.4-26 R-3 Diamond Tread Non-Directional Tire City Number 96-5-
44 4| ea |06261 720.00 2,880.00 699.98 2,799.92 650.00 2,600.00 599.40 2,397.60
P225/75R15 BF Goodrich Longtrail 41881, or approved equivalent.
45 8| ea |Tire Fits Chevy Colorado City Number 96-5-06265 74.50 596.00 64.00 512.00 61.00 488.00 99.32 794.56
LT235/80R17 General Ameritrac 0456645 ((No Substitutions). Tire Fits
46 12| ea [Dodge Ambulance City Number 96-5-06270 145.00 1,740.00 100.09 1,201.08 144.00 1,728.00 No Bid
P245/65R17 Michelin X Radial LT2 14093 (No Substitutions). Tire Fits
47 4| ea |07 Police Chevy Trailblazer City Number 96-5-06275 145.00 580.00 71.49 285.96 No Bid No Bid
245/75R16 Firestone Transforce AT 189-582 (No Substitutions). Tire is
48 8| ea |for Parks Department Vehicles City Number 96-5-06278 77.50 620.00 77.74 621.92 85.90 687.20 No Bid
225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250F Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire
49 12| ea |[Fits Ford Bucket Trucks City Number 96-5-06280 169.50 2,034.00 174.10 2,089.20 174.00 2,088.00 No Bid
Awarded Bid Awarded Bid Awarded Bid Awarded Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $ 167,155.00 $  41,445.97 $ 22,456.20 $ 15,664.12
LESS DISCOUNT: (1,671.55)
NET TOTAL: $ 165,483.45 $  41,445.97 $ 22,456.20 $ 15,664.12
TERMS: 1% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY: 1-3 Calendar Days 2 Calendar Days 5 Calendar Days 7 Calendar Days
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  May 4, 2010 2:00 p.m.
. . Blagg Tire & Service
Ato Z Tire & Battery, Inc. Diamond Service Center Inc. Blagg Tire & Service (alternate 2)
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
12-16.5TR 001301 Bobcat Tire (Must be Non-Directional) City Number
1 12| ea [96-5-06000 224.19 2,690.28 162.68 1,952.16 129.95 1,559.40 129.95 1,559.40
P205-65SR15 Bridgestone 026-359, or approved equivalent City
2 8| ea [Number 96-5-06001 48.87 390.96 48.30 386.40 52.48 419.84 52.48 419.84
LT215/85/R16 Firestone Transforce HT 187-701, or approved
3 24| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06002 90.35 2,168.40 94.05 2,257.20 83.64 2,007.36 83.64 2,007.36
P225/60VR16 Goodyear RSA V Rated 734-354-500, or approved
4 275| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06003 87.82 24,150.50 No Bid 64.25 17,668.75 64.25 17,668.75
LT245/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler RSA 179-469-492, or approved
5 12| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06004 120.10 1,441.20 120.88 1,450.56 94.54 1,134.48 94.54 1,134.48
355/70D17.5 Firestone Duraforce 371-453 (No Substitutions) City
6 12| ea [Number 96-5-06006 302.60 3,631.20 No Bid 333.00 3,996.00 333.00 3,996.00
11L15 Carlisle/Firestone 326011 (Backhoe), or approved equivalent
7 8| ea |City Number 96-5-06007 119.69 957.52 142.33 1,138.64 144.28 1,154.24 144.28 1,154.24
P215/60R16 Firestone TR380 061-991, or approved equivalent City
8 8| ea [Number 96-5-06008 56.61 452.88 56.54 452.32 63.48 507.84 63.48 507.84
225/70R19.5 Bridgestone M724F 272-876 (No Substitutions) City
9 18| ea [Number 96-5-06009 116.92 2,104.56 No Bid 181.22 3,261.96 181.22 3,261.96
P235/75R16 BF Goodrich Long Trail #22027, or approved equivalent
10 8| ea |City Number 96-5-06010 82.91 663.28 77.72 621.76 82.44 659.52 82.44 659.52
P235/75R15 Bridgestone SE200 026-036, or approved equivalent City
11 4| ea [Number 96-5-06011 56.61 226.44 65.14 260.56 68.94 275.76 68.94 275.76
235/55R17 Firestone 077-325, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits 06 -08
12 134 ea |Crown Victoria City Number 96-5-06012 110.50 14,807.00 80.97 10,849.98 84.99 11,388.66 84.99 11,388.66
P225/60R18 Continental Contipro Contact 99V 1547465, or approved
13 145| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06014 98.82 14,328.90 89.98 13,047.10 94.99 13,773.55 106.99 15,513.55
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 183-601-418, or approved
14 18| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06015 87.02 1,566.36 83.53 1,503.54 86.98 1,565.64 86.98 1,565.64
4.80-4.00-8 Carlisle Turfsaver 511250, or approved equivalent City
15 6] ea [Number 96-5-06016 15.85 95.10 No Bid 20.22 121.32 20.22 121.32
23-10.50-12 Carlisle Turfsaver 511121, or approved equivalent City
16 2| ea |[Number 96-5-06017 52.49 104.98 63.43 126.86 75.99 151.98 75.99 151.98
16x6.50x8 Carlise Turfsaver 511401, or approved equivalent City
17 6] ea [Number 96-5-06018 17.94 107.64 41.11 246.66 36.92 221.52 36.92 221.52
P225/70R15 Firestone Firehawk 067-938, or approved equivalent City
18 4| ea |[Number 96-5-06020 60.62 242.48 66.96 267.84 69.99 279.96 69.99 279.96
GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  May 4, 2010 2:00 p.m.
. . Blagg Tire & Service
A'to Z Tire & Battery, Inc. Diamond Service Center Inc. Blagg Tire & Service (alteranate 2)
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
P215/75R15 Goodyear 402-391-436, or approved equivalent City
19 10{ ea [Number 96-5-06025 54.01 540.10 58.14 581.40 54.71 547.10 54.71 547.10
P215/60R15 Goodyear Eagle GT 94V 100-849-277, or approved
20 18| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06026 63.45 1,142.10 87.77 1,579.86 59.48 1,070.64 59.48 1,070.64
LT235/85R16 Firestone Transforce HT 189-718, or approved
21 24| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06027 94.28 2,262.72 93.79 2,250.96 77.29 1,854.96 77.29 1,854.96
7.50R16 Hankook F19 2000863 Trailer Tire, or approved equivalent
22 12| ea |City Number 96-5-06030 118.27 1,419.24 No Bid 139.94 1,679.28 139.94 1,679.28
11R22.5 Highway Tire Firestone 156-558, or approved equivalent City
23 375/ ea |Number 96-5-06032 199.35 74,756.25 261.99 98,246.25 223.49 83,808.75 223.49 83,808.75
P205/70R15 Goodyear Integrity 402-117-436, or approved equivalent
24 10| ea |City Number 96-5-06035 49.21 492.10 45.15 451.50 54.10 541.00 54.10 541.00
LT225/75R16 Firestone Transforce 189-752, or approved equivalent
25 120| ea |City Number 96-5-06040 90.19 10,822.80 95.78 11,493.60 74.79 8,974.80 74.79 8,974.80
LT225/75R17 General Grabber AW 4569100000, or approved
26 8| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06045 No Bid No Bid 94.15 753.20 94.15 753.20
245/75R22.5 Goodyear G149 RSA (No Substitutions). Tire Fits 2010
27 32| ea |IHC Sideloader City Number 96-5-06105 No Bid 240.49 7,695.68 219.99 7,039.68 219.99 7,039.68
11R22.5 Mud Tire Firestone T831 281-557 (No Substitutions) City
28 126| ea |[Number 96-05-06110 204.05 25,710.30 269.96 34,014.96 252.99 31,876.74 252.99 31,876.74
LT245/75R16 Eagle Wrangler HT 748-747-188, or approved equivalent
29 100| ea |City Number 96-5-06115 96.05 9,605.00 96.87 9,687.00 113.08 11,308.00 113.08 11,308.00
LT245/75R17 Continental Contitrac 0432008 (No Substitutions). Tire
30 60| ea |Fits Ford Ambulance City Number 96-5-06120 129.56 7,773.60 114.48 6,868.80 141.22 8,473.20 141.22 8,473.20
205/75R15 Goodyear Integrity, or approved equivalent City Number 96-
31 12| ea |5-06150 50.18 602.16 52.93 635.16 51.12 613.44 51.12 613.44
7.50x16 Firestone FR380 339-245, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
32 4| ea |Case Tractor City Number 96-5-06201 70.98 283.92 97.60 390.40 71.00 284.00 71.00 284.00
P205/75R14 Goodyear Integrity, or approved equivalent City Number
33 24| ea |96-5-06213 56.42 1,354.08 46.96 1,127.04 44.57 1,069.68 44.57 1,069.68
11L-16 Firestone F3 314-625, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits Ford
34 20| ea |Backhoes City Number 96-5-06216 117.26 2,345.20 143.39 2,867.80 133.98 2,679.60 133.98 2,679.60
9.50R16.5 Firestone 189-820, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
35 30| ea |Interstate Trailers City Number 96-5-06224 122.44 3,673.20 No Bid 94.17 2,825.10 94.17 2,825.10
12R22.5 Bridgestone R250F 292-850, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
36 8| ea |Fire Truck City Number 96-5-06230 249.44 1,995.52 312.96 2,503.68 277.99 2,223.92 277.99 2,223.92

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

TERMS:

DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  April 21, 2009 2:00 p.m.
. . Blagg Tire & Service
Ato Z Tire & Battery, Inc. Diamond Service Center Inc. Blagg Tire & Service (alteranate 2)
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
11R22.5 Firestone R250ED 206-973, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
37 33| ea |Fire Truck City Number 96-5-06232 199.35 6,578.55 305.97 10,097.01 243.99 8,051.67 243.99 8,051.67
385/65R22.5 Firestone 839 Widebase 294-586, or approved equivalent
38 2| ea |City Number 96-5-06233 381.57 763.14 504.95 1,009.90 312.49 624.98 312.49 624.98
39 4| ea [20.5 E3/L3 20 Ply Non-Directional City Number 96-5-06234 825.00 3,300.00 | 1,057.62 4,230.48 814.95 3,259.80 814.95 3,259.80
315/80R22.5 Michelin XZA1 Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
40 12| ea [Truck City Number 96-5-06235 267.22 3,206.64 413.19 4,958.28 272.99 3,275.88 415.00 4,980.00
425/65R22.5 Michelin XFE Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
41 8| ea |Truck City Number 96-5-06236 459.13 3,673.04 534.96 4,279.68 375.99 3,007.92 375.99 3,007.92
385/65R22.5 Michelin XFE Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
42 8| ea |Truck City Number 96-5-06237 381.57 3,052.56 474.69 3,797.52 308.99 2,471.92 308.99 2,471.92
43 4| ea [16-9-24 R-3 Turf Tire 6 Ply Diamond Tread City Number 96-5-06260 580.00 2,320.00 449.68 1,798.72 499.98 1,999.92 499.98 1,999.92
18.4-26 R-3 Diamond Tread Non-Directional Tire City Number 96-5-
44 4| ea 06261 735.31 2,941.24 721.78 2,887.12 699.98 2,799.92 699.98 2,799.92
P225/75R15 BF Goodrich Longtrail 41881, or approved equivalent.
45 8| ea |[Tire Fits Chevy Colorado City Number 96-5-06265 54.65 437.20 65.73 525.84 67.68 541.44 67.68 541.44
LT235/80R17 General Ameritrac 0456645 ((No Substitutions). Tire Fits
46 12| ea [Dodge Ambulance City Number 96-5-06270 126.36 1,516.32 127.86 1,534.32 136.03 1,632.36 136.03 1,632.36
P245/65R17 Michelin X Radial LT2 14093 (No Substitutions). Tire Fits
47 4| ea |07 Police Chevy Trailblazer City Number 96-5-06275 93.38 373.52 No Bid 71.49 285.96 71.49 285.96
245/75R16 Firestone Transforce AT 189-582 (No Substitutions). Tire is
48 8| ea |for Parks Department Vehicles City Number 96-5-06278 92.88 743.04 101.37 810.96 77.74 621.92 77.74 621.92
225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250F Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire
49 12| ea |Fits Ford Bucket Trucks City Number 96-5-06280 116.92 1,403.04 219.96 2,639.52 174.10 2,089.20 174.10 2,089.20
Awarded Bid Awarded Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $ 5,747.70 $ 5,367.68 $ 258,433.76 $ 261,877.88
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $ 5,747.70 $ 5,367.68 $ 258,433.76 $ 261,877.88
TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY: 2 Calendar Days 1-10 Calendar Days 2 Calendar Days 2 Calendar Days
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066

Date:  May 4, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Wingfoot Commercial Tire Dallas Dodge Chrysler Jeep
Systgems, LLC (alternate 1) Dallas Dodge Chrysler Jeep (alternate 1) B&S Transport Inc.
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
12-16.5TR 001301 Bobcat Tire (Must be Non-Directional) City Number
1 12| ea [96-5-06000 166.80 2,001.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
P205-65SR15 Bridgestone 026-359, or approved equivalent City
2 8| ea [Number 96-5-06001 60.45 483.60 No Bid 73.23 585.84 64.52 516.16
LT215/85/R16 Firestone Transforce HT 187-701, or approved
3 24| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06002 104.36 2,504.64 123.37 2,960.88 123.37 2,960.88 94.96 2,279.04
P225/60VR16 Goodyear RSA V Rated 734-354-500, or approved
4 275| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06003 74.50 20,487.50 138.60 38,115.00 138.60 38,115.00 78.53 21,595.75
LT245/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler RSA 179-469-492, or approved
5 12| ea [equivalent City Number 96-5-06004 123.24 1,478.88 174.56 2,094.72 174.56 2,094.72 110.18 1,322.16
355/70D17.5 Firestone Duraforce 371-453 (No Substitutions) City
6 12| ea [Number 96-5-06006 No Bid No Bid No Bid 478.51 5,742.12
11L15 Carlisle/Firestone 326011 (Backhoe), or approved equivalent
7 8| ea |[City Number 96-5-06007 90.79 726.32 No Bid No Bid 203.71 1,629.68
P215/60R16 Firestone TR380 061-991, or approved equivalent City
8 8| ea [Number 96-5-06008 71.73 573.84 76.38 611.04 76.38 611.04 84.16 673.28
225/70R19.5 Bridgestone M724F 272-876 (No Substitutions) City
9 18| ea [Number 96-5-06009 No Bid No Bid No Bid 179.86 3,237.48
P235/75R16 BF Goodrich Long Trail #22027, or approved equivalent
10 8| ea |[City Number 96-5-06010 95.78 766.24 110.51 884.08 110.51 884.08 91.80 734.40
P235/75R15 Bridgestone SE200 026-036, or approved equivalent City
11 4[ ea |Number 96-5-06011 67.15 268.60 77.17 308.68 77.17 308.68 67.82 271.28
235/55R17 Firestone 077-325, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits 06 -08
12 134| ea |[Crown Victoria City Number 96-5-06012 102.67 13,757.78 292.68 39,219.12 292.68 39,219.12 94.00 12,596.00
P225/60R18 Continental Contipro Contact 99V 1547465, or approved
13 145| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06014 112.00 16,240.00 176.13 25,538.85 176.13 25,538.85 104.00 15,080.00
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 183-601-418, or approved
14 18| ea [equivalent City Number 96-5-06015 95.48 1,718.64 123.90 2,230.20 123.90 2,230.20 103.85 1,869.30
4.80-4.00-8 Carlisle Turfsaver 511250, or approved equivalent City
15 6| ea [Number 96-5-06016 18.40 110.40 No Bid No Bid 30.30 181.80
23-10.50-12 Carlisle Turfsaver 511121, or approved equivalent City
16 2| ea [Number 96-5-06017 35.88 71.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16x6.50x8 Carlise Turfsaver 511401, or approved equivalent City
17 6| ea [Number 96-5-06018 20.72 124.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid
P225/70R15 Firestone Firehawk 067-938, or approved equivalent City
18 4| ea |Number 96-5-06020 74.00 296.00 89.25 357.00 89.25 357.00 No Bid
GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  May 4, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Wingfoot Commercial Tire Dallas Dodge Chrysler Jeep
Systgms, LLC (alternate 1) Dallas Dodge Chrysler Jeep (alternate 1) B&S Transport Inc.
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
P215/75R15 Goodyear 402-391-436, or approved equivalent City
19 10| ea [Number 96-5-06025 75.40 754.00 77.43 774.30 77.43 774.30 No Bid
P215/60R15 Goodyear Eagle GT 94V 100-849-277, or approved
20 18| ea [equivalent City Number 96-5-06026 58.70 1,056.60 82.95 1,493.10 82.95 1,493.10 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Firestone Transforce HT 189-718, or approved
21 24| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06027 89.00 2,136.00 129.15 3,099.60 129.15 3,099.60 No Bid
7.50R16 Hankook F19 2000863 Trailer Tire, or approved equivalent
22 12| ea [City Number 96-5-06030 122.05 1,464.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 Highway Tire Firestone 156-558, or approved equivalent City
23 375| ea [Number 96-5-06032 269.01 100,878.75 No Bid No Bid 258.64 96,990.00
P205/70R15 Goodyear Integrity 402-117-436, or approved equivalent
24 10| ea [City Number 96-5-06035 59.51 595.10 77.43 774.30 77.43 774.30 No Bid
LT225/75R16 Firestone Transforce 189-752, or approved equivalent
25 120 ea |City Number 96-5-06040 89.00 10,680.00 129.15 15,498.00 129.15 15,498.00 101.47 12,176.40
LT225/75R17 General Grabber AW 4569100000, or approved
26 8| ea [equivalent City Number 96-5-06045 No Bid 146.21 1,169.68 146.21 1,169.68 No Bid
245/75R22.5 Goodyear G149 RSA (No Substitutions). Tire Fits 2010
27 32| ea |IHC Sideloader City Number 96-5-06105 300.55 9,617.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 Mud Tire Firestone T831 281-557 (No Substitutions) City
28 126 ea |Number 96-05-06110 381.26 48,038.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid
LT245/75R16 Eagle Wrangler HT 748-747-188, or approved equivalent
29 100 ea |City Number 96-5-06115 136.66 13,666.00 189.26 18,926.00 189.26 18,926.00 No Bid
LT245/75R17 Continental Contitrac 0432008 (No Substitutions). Tire
30 60 ea |Fits Ford Ambulance City Number 96-5-06120 No Bid 162.22 9,733.20 162.22 9,733.20 No Bid
205/75R15 Goodyear Integrity, or approved equivalent City Number 96
31 12 ea |5-06150 59.18 710.16 74.02 888.24 74.02 888.24 No Bid
7.50x16 Firestone FR380 339-245, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
32 4| ea |Case Tractor City Number 96-5-06201 89.90 359.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
P205/75R14 Goodyear Integrity, or approved equivalent City Number
33 24| ea |96-5-06213 56.47 1,355.28 65.62 1,574.88 65.62 1,574.88 No Bid
11L-16 Firestone F3 314-625, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits Ford
34 20| ea |Backhoes City Number 96-5-06216 133.55 2,671.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9.50R16.5 Firestone 189-820, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
35 30| ea |Interstate Trailers City Number 96-5-06224 133.79 4,013.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12R22.5 Bridgestone R250F 292-850, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
36 8| ea [Fire Truck City Number 96-5-06230 403.86 3,230.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  April 21, 2009 2:00 p.m.
Wingfoot Commercial Tire Dallas Dodge Chrysler Jeep
Systgms, LLC (alternate 1) Dallas Dodge Chrysler Jeep (alternate 1) B&S Transport Inc.
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
11R22.5 Firestone R250ED 206-973, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
37 33| ea |Fire Truck City Number 96-5-06232 303.00 9,999.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
385/65R22.5 Firestone 839 Widebase 294-586, or approved equivalent
38 2| ea |City Number 96-5-06233 455.93 911.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid
39 4| ea |20.5 E3/L3 20 Ply Non-Directional City Number 96-5-06234 751.20 3,004.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
315/80R22.5 Michelin XZA1 Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
40 12| ea [Truck City Number 96-5-06235 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
425/65R22.5 Michelin XFE Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
41 8| ea [Truck City Number 96-5-06236 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
385/65R22.5 Michelin XFE Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
42 8| ea [Truck City Number 96-5-06237 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 4| ea |16-9-24 R-3 Turf Tire 6 Ply Diamond Tread City Number 96-5-06260 448.56 1,794.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18.4-26 R-3 Diamond Tread Non-Directional Tire City Number 96-5-
44 4| ea 06261 599.40 2,397.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
P225/75R15 BF Goodrich Longtrail 41881, or approved equivalent.
45 8| ea |[Tire Fits Chevy Colorado City Number 96-5-06265 99.32 794.56 97.65 781.20 97.65 781.20 No Bid
LT235/80R17 General Ameritrac 0456645 ((No Substitutions). Tire Fits
46 12| ea [Dodge Ambulance City Number 96-5-06270 No Bid 155.40 1,864.80 155.40 1,864.80 No Bid
P245/65R17 Michelin X Radial LT2 14093 (No Substitutions). Tire Fits
47 4| ea |07 Police Chevy Trailblazer City Number 96-5-06275 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
245/75R16 Firestone Transforce AT 189-582 (No Substitutions). Tire is
48 8| ea |for Parks Department Vehicles City Number 96-5-06278 No Bid 142.01 1,136.08 142.01 1,136.08 No Bid
225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250F Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire
49 12| ea |Fits Ford Bucket Trucks City Number 96-5-06280 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $ 281,740.21 $ 170,032.95 $ 170,618.79 $ 176,894.85
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $ 281,740.21 $ 170,032.95 $ 170,618.79 $ 176,894.85
TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY: 7 Calendar Days 7 Calendar Days 7 Calendar Days 3 Calendar Days
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066

Date:  May 4, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Diamond Service Center Inc.|Diamond Service Center Inc. Texas Correctional
(alternate 1) (alternate 2) Tire Centers LLC Industries
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
12-16.5TR 001301 Bobcat Tire (Must be Non-Directional) City Number
1 12| ea [96-5-06000 154.45 1,853.40 335.00 4,020.00 325.00 3,900.00 No Bid
P205-65SR15 Bridgestone 026-359, or approved equivalent City
2 8| ea |Number 96-5-06001 75.42 603.36 48.30 386.40 77.66 621.28 No Bid
LT215/85/R16 Firestone Transforce HT 187-701, or approved
3 24| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06002 90.67 2,176.08 94.05 2,257.20 95.05 2,281.20 No Bid
P225/60VR16 Goodyear RSA V Rated 734-354-500, or approved
4 275| ea [equivalent City Number 96-5-06003 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LT245/70R17 Goodyear Wrangler RSA 179-469-492, or approved
5 12| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06004 137.36 1,648.32 120.88 1,450.56 91.66 1,099.92 No Bid
355/70D17.5 Firestone Duraforce 371-453 (No Substitutions) City
6 12| ea [Number 96-5-06006 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11L15 Carlisle/Firestone 326011 (Backhoe), or approved equivalent
7 8| ea |City Number 96-5-06007 144.43 1,155.44 142.33 1,138.64 223.00 1,784.00 No Bid
P215/60R16 Firestone TR380 061-991, or approved equivalent City
8 8| ea |Number 96-5-06008 56.54 452.32 56.54 452.32 69.42 555.36 No Bid
225/70R19.5 Bridgestone M724F 272-876 (No Substitutions) City
9 18| ea [Number 96-5-06009 No Bid No Bid 223.46 4,022.28 No Bid
P235/75R16 BF Goodrich Long Trail #22027, or approved equivalent
10 8| ea |City Number 96-5-06010 77.72 621.76 77.72 621.76 78.72 629.76 No Bid
P235/75R15 Bridgestone SE200 026-036, or approved equivalent City
11 4| ea |Number 96-5-06011 73.97 295.88 65.14 260.56 86.81 347.24 No Bid
235/55R17 Firestone 077-325, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits 06 -08
12 134| ea |Crown Victoria City Number 96-5-06012 155.87 20,886.58 80.97 10,849.98 99.00 13,266.00 No Bid
P225/60R18 Continental Contipro Contact 99V 1547465, or approved
13 145| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06014 89.98 13,047.10 89.98 13,047.10 99.00 14,355.00 No Bid
P255/70R16 Goodyear Wrangler SRA 183-601-418, or approved
14 18| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06015 90.89 1,636.02 83.53 1,503.54 84.54 1,521.72 No Bid
4.80-4.00-8 Carlisle Turfsaver 511250, or approved equivalent City
15 6| ea [Number 96-5-06016 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23-10.50-12 Carlisle Turfsaver 511121, or approved equivalent City
16 2| ea [Number 96-5-06017 63.43 126.86 63.43 126.86 No Bid No Bid
16x6.50x8 Carlise Turfsaver 511401, or approved equivalent City
17 6] ea [Number 96-5-06018 41.11 246.66 41.11 246.66 No Bid No Bid
P225/70R15 Firestone Firehawk 067-938, or approved equivalent City
18 4| ea |Number 96-5-06020 61.67 246.68 66.96 267.84 70.09 280.36 No Bid
GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066

Date:  May 4, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Diamond Service Center Inc.|Diamond Service Center Inc. Texas Correctional
(alternate 1) (alternate 2) Tire Centers LLC Industries
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
P215/75R15 Goodyear 402-391-436, or approved equivalent City
19 10| ea [Number 96-5-06025 60.97 609.70 83.92 839.20 61.98 619.80 No Bid
P215/60R15 Goodyear Eagle GT 94V 100-849-277, or approved
20 18| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06026 87.77 1,579.86 87.77 1,579.86 58.32 1,049.76 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Firestone Transforce HT 189-718, or approved
21 24| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06027 99.98 2,399.52 135.49 3,251.76 101.18 2,428.32 No Bid
7.50R16 Hankook F19 2000863 Trailer Tire, or approved equivalent
22 12| ea |City Number 96-5-06030 No Bid No Bid 139.00 1,668.00 No Bid
11R22.5 Highway Tire Firestone 156-558, or approved equivalent City
23 375 ea |Number 96-5-06032 294.76 110,535.00 261.99 98,246.25 265.99 99,746.25 No Bid
P205/70R15 Goodyear Integrity 402-117-436, or approved equivalent
24 10| ea |City Number 96-5-06035 45.15 451.50 45.15 451.50 54.69 546.90 No Bid
LT225/75R16 Firestone Transforce 189-752, or approved equivalent
25 120| ea |City Number 96-5-06040 99.99 11,998.80 95.78 11,493.60 97.78 11,733.60 No Bid
LT225/75R17 General Grabber AW 4569100000, or approved
26 8| ea |equivalent City Number 96-5-06045 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
245/75R22.5 Goodyear G149 RSA (No Substitutions). Tire Fits 2010
27 32| ea |IHC Sideloader City Number 96-5-06105 240.49 7,695.68 240.49 7,695.68 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 Mud Tire Firestone T831 281-557 (No Substitutions) City
28 126| ea |Number 96-05-06110 316.75 39,910.50 269.96 34,014.96 316.75 39,910.50 No Bid
LT245/75R16 Eagle Wrangler HT 748-747-188, or approved equivalent
29 100| ea |City Number 96-5-06115 97.98 9,798.00 96.87 9,687.00 99.18 9,918.00 No Bid
LT245/75R17 Continental Contitrac 0432008 (No Substitutions). Tire
30 60| ea |Fits Ford Ambulance City Number 96-5-06120 107.97 6,478.20 114.48 6,868.80 159.31 9,558.60 No Bid
205/75R15 Goodyear Integrity, or approved equivalent City Number 96
31 12| ea [5-06150 52.93 635.16 52.93 635.16 54.76 657.12 No Bid
7.50x16 Firestone FR380 339-245, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
32 4| ea |Case Tractor City Number 96-5-06201 97.60 390.40 97.60 390.40 No Bid No Bid
P205/75R14 Goodyear Integrity, or approved equivalent City Number
33 24| ea |96-5-06213 66.96 1,607.04 46.96 1,127.04 48.10 1,154.40 No Bid
11L-16 Firestone F3 314-625, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits Ford
34 20| ea |Backhoes City Number 96-5-06216 164.99 3,299.80 143.39 2,867.80 No Bid No Bid
9.50R16.5 Firestone 189-820, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
35 30| ea |[Interstate Trailers City Number 96-5-06224 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12R22.5 Bridgestone R250F 292-850, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
36 8| ea |Fire Truck City Number 96-5-06230 362.97 2,903.76 312.96 2,503.68 365.48 2,923.84 No Bid
GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Tires
Bid No: 2010-066
Date:  April 21, 2009 2:00 p.m.
Diamond Service Center Inc.|Diamond Service Center Inc. Texas Correctional
(alternate 1) (alternate 2) Tire Centers LLC Industries
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
11R22.5 Firestone R250ED 206-973, or approved equivalent. Tire Fits
37 33| ea |Fire Truck City Number 96-5-06232 263.79 8,705.07 305.97 10,097.01 351.37 11,595.21 No Bid
385/65R22.5 Firestone 839 Widebase 294-586, or approved equivalent
38 2| ea [City Number 96-5-06233 457.96 915.92 504.95 1,009.90 477.75 955.50 No Bid
39 4| ea |20.5 E3/L3 20 Ply Non-Directional City Number 96-5-06234 2,234.52 8,938.08 [ 1,057.62 4,230.48 | 2,262.94 9,051.76 No Bid
315/80R22.5 Michelin XZA1 Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
40 12| ea |[Truck City Number 96-5-06235 413.19 4,958.28 413.19 4,958.28 416.24 4,994.88 No Bid
425/65R22.5 Michelin XFE Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
41 8| ea |Truck City Number 96-5-06236 534.96 4,279.68 534.96 4,279.68 538.07 4,304.56 No Bid
385/65R22.5 Michelin XFE Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire Fits Fire
42 8| ea |Truck City Number 96-5-06237 474.69 3,797.52 474.69 3,797.52 477.75 3,822.00 No Bid
43 4| ea |16-9-24 R-3 Turf Tire 6 Ply Diamond Tread City Number 96-5-06260 449.68 1,798.72 449.68 1,798.72 | 1,234.01 4,936.04 No Bid
18.4-26 R-3 Diamond Tread Non-Directional Tire City Number 96-5-
44 4| ea |06261 721.78 2,887.12 721.78 2,887.12 | 1,328.38 5,313.52 No Bid
P225/75R15 BF Goodrich Longtrail 41881, or approved equivalent.
45 8| ea |Tire Fits Chevy Colorado City Number 96-5-06265 65.73 525.84 65.73 525.84 67.53 540.24 No Bid
LT235/80R17 General Ameritrac 0456645 ((No Substitutions). Tire Fits
46 12| ea |Dodge Ambulance City Number 96-5-06270 127.86 1,534.32 127.86 1,534.32 No Bid No Bid
P245/65R17 Michelin X Radial LT2 14093 (No Substitutions). Tire Fits
47 4| ea |07 Police Chevy Trailblazer City Number 96-5-06275 No Bid No Bid 140.01 560.04 No Bid
245/75R16 Firestone Transforce AT 189-582 (No Substitutions). Tire is
48 8| ea |for Parks Department Vehicles City Number 96-5-06278 101.37 810.96 101.37 810.96 102.69 821.52 No Bid
225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250F Steer Tire (No Substitutions). Tire
49 12| ea |Fits Ford Bucket Trucks City Number 96-5-06280 219.96 2,639.52 219.96 2,639.52 223.46 2,681.52 No Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $ 287,080.41 $ 256,851.46 $ 276,156.00 No Bid
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $ 287,080.41 $ 256,851.46 $ 276,156.00 No Bid
TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY: 1-10 Calendar Days 1-10 Calendar Days 2 Calendar Days
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