
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Police Body Armor
Bid No: 2010-051
Date: February 4, 2010 2:00 PM

Code Blue
GST Public Safety Supply, 

LLC Nardis Public Safety
Protective Products 

International
Item Qty. Unit Description Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended

CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 
OPTION NO. 1

1 45 Ea.
American Body Armor "Xtreme HP 
Armor, per specifications  No Bid 679.00       30,555.00    649.00       29,205.00  

1 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 1 EQUIVALENT   458.00       20,610.00     
OPTION NO. 1 TOTAL No Bid  30,555.00    20,610.00    29,205.00  

      

   CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 
OPTION NO. 2         

2 45 Ea.
Valley Operational Wear, LLC, per 
specifications 608.26       27,371.70     619.00       27,855.00     649.00       29,205.00  

2 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 2 EQUIVALENT    589.50       26,527.50     
OPTION NO. 2 TOTAL 27,371.70     27,855.00    26,527.50    29,205.00  

        

CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 
OPTION NO. 3         

3 45 Ea.
First Choice Armor and Equipment Inc., 
per specifications No Bid 650.00       29,250.00      649.00       29,205.00  

3 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 3 EQUIVALENT  505.00       22,725.00    685.50       30,847.50      
OPTION NO. 3 TOTAL No Bid 29,250.00    30,847.50    29,205.00  

 GROSS TOTAL   
 LESS DISCOUNT  
 NET TOTAL   

TERMS
DELIVERY
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Police Body Armor
Bid No: 2010-051
Date: February 4, 2010 2:00 PM

Code Blue
GST Public Safety Supply, 

LLC Nardis Public Safety
Protective Products 

International

Item Qty. Unit Description Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended

CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 
OPTION NO. 4

4 45 Ea.
Valley Operational Wear, LLC Warrior 
Series, per specifications No Bid 544.00       24,480.00    649.00       29,205.00  

4 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 4 EQUIVALENT 458.27       20,622.15      579.50       26,077.50     
OPTION NO. 4 TOTAL 20,622.15     24,480.00    26,077.50    29,205.00  

      

   CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 
OPTION NO. 5         

5 45 Ea.

The GH Armor Systems soft concealable 
body armor, per specifications No Bid 600.00       27,000.00    649.00       29,205.00  

5 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 5 EQUIVALENT     480.00       21,600.00    
OPTION NO. 5 TOTAL No Bid 27,000.00    21,600.00    29,205.00  

        

CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR FOR 
WOMEN         

1 7 Ea.
SAVVY TM FEM PST IIIA 1.1 NIJ, per 
specifications No Bid No Bid No Bid 649.00       4,543.00    

1 7 Ea.
CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR FOR 

WOMEN EQUIVALENT      
    

 GROSS TOTAL
 LESS DISCOUNT
 NET TOTAL

TERMS
DELIVERY
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Police Body Armor
Bid No: 2010-051
Date: February 4, 2010 2:00 PM

Code Blue
GST Public Safety Supply, 

LLC Nardis Public Safety
Protective Products 

International
Item Qty. Unit Description Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended

TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 1

1 10 Ea.
Point Blank Body Armor, Dragon Fire 
Vest, per specifications 1,702.00    17,020.00     1,453.00    14,530.00    1,520.00    15,200.00    1,599.00    15,990.00  

 10  OPTION NO. 1 EQUIVALENT       
TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 1 

TOTAL 17,020.00     14,530.00    15,200.00    15,990.00  
      

   
TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 2        

2 10 Ea.
Protech Tactical Body Armor, per 
specifications No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,599.00    15,990.00  

2 10 Ea. OPTION NO. 2 EQUIVALENT     

TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 2 
TOTAL No Bid No Bid No Bid 15,990.00  

   

TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 3        

3 10 Ea.
The GH Armor Systems soft body armor, 
per specifications No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,599.00    15,990.00  

3 10 Ea. OPTION NO. 3 EQUIVALENT     
OPTION NO. 3 TOTAL No Bid No Bid No Bid 15,990.00  

Warranty

Misc. Information

Awarded Bid Awarded Bid

 GROSS TOTAL 14,530.00$  20,610.00$  
 LESS DISCOUNT
 NET TOTAL 14,530.00$  20,610.00$  

TERMS 1% 10, Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY 30 Calendar Days 6 - 8 Weeks 30 - 44 Calendar Days 30 Calendar Days
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Police Body Armor
Bid No: 2010-051
Date: February 4, 2010 2:00 PM

Tactical Gear Now, Inc.
Item Qty. Unit Description Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended

CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 
OPTION NO. 1

1 45 Ea.
American Body Armor "Xtreme HP 
Armor, per specifications  No Bid

1 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 1 EQUIVALENT  
OPTION NO. 1 TOTAL No Bid

  

   
CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 

OPTION NO. 2   

2 45 Ea.
Valley Operational Wear, LLC, Legends 
Series, per specifications No Bid

2 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 2 EQUIVALENT   
OPTION NO. 2 TOTAL No Bid

    
CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 

OPTION NO. 3   

3 45 Ea.
First Choice Armor and Equipment Inc., 
per specifications No Bid

3 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 3 EQUIVALENT   
OPTION NO. 3 TOTAL No Bid

 GROSS TOTAL   
 LESS DISCOUNT  
 NET TOTAL   

TERMS
DELIVERY
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Police Body Armor
Bid No: 2010-051
Date: February 4, 2010 2:00 PM

Tactical Gear Now, Inc.
Item Qty. Unit Description Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended

CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 
OPTION NO. 4

4 45 Ea.
Valley Operational Wear, LLC Warrior 
Series, per specifications No Bid

4 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 4 EQUIVALENT  
OPTION NO. 4 TOTAL No Bid

  

   
CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR 

OPTION NO. 5   

5 45 Ea.

The GH Armor Systems soft concealable 
body armor, per specifications 705.50       31,747.50     

5 45 Ea. OPTION NO. 5 EQUIVALENT   
OPTION NO. 5 TOTAL 31,747.50     

    
CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR FOR 

WOMEN   

1 7 Ea.
SAVVY TM FEM PST IIIA 1.1 NIJ, per 
specifications No Bid

1 7 Ea.
CONCEALABLE BODY ARMOR FOR 

WOMEN EQUIVALENT  

 GROSS TOTAL
 LESS DISCOUNT
 NET TOTAL

TERMS
DELIVERY
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Police Body Armor
Bid No: 2010-051
Date: February 4, 2010 2:00 PM

Tactical Gear Now, Inc.
Item Qty. Unit Description Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended Unit Price Extended

TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 1

1 10 Ea.
Point Blank Body Armor, Dragon Fire 
Vest, per specifications No Bid

 10  OPTION NO. 1 EQUIVALENT  
TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 1 

TOTAL No Bid
 

   TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 2  

2 10 Ea.
Protech Tactical Body Armor, per 
specifications No Bid

2 10 Ea. OPTION NO. 2 EQUIVALENT  
TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 2 

TOTAL No Bid
  

TACTICAL BODY ARMOR OPTION 3   

3 10 Ea.
The GH Armor Systems soft body armor, 
per specifications 2,006.25    20,062.50     

3 10 Ea. OPTION NO. 3 EQUIVALENT
OPTION NO. 3 TOTAL

Warranty

Misc. Information

 GROSS TOTAL
 LESS DISCOUNT
 NET TOTAL

TERMS Net 30
DELIVERY 30 - 45 Calendar Days
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	As Awarded

