CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Fire Hydrants
Bid No: 2010-049
Date:  February 11, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Ferguson Waterworks Metro Valve Pipe Mainline Supply Company ACT Pipe Supply
ITEM QTY |[UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
1 25| ea |5' Bury Fire Hydrant 1,350.00 33,750.00 1,350.37 33,759.25 1,433.00 35,825.00 1,405.00 35,125.00
2 25| ea |4' Bury Fire Hydrant 1,295.00 32,375.00 1,317.60 32,940.00 1,346.00 33,650.00 1,346.00 33,650.00
3 6| ea [3'Bury Fire Hydrant 1,235.00 7,410.00 1,256.40 7,538.40 1,221.00 7,326.00 1,280.00 7,680.00
Awarded Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $  73,535.00 $  74,237.65 $  76,801.00 $  76,455.00
LESS DISCOUNT: (1,536.02)
NET TOTAL: $  73,535.00 $  74,237.65 $  75,264.98 $  76,455.00
TERMS: Net 30 Not Stated 2% 10 Days Net 30
DELIVERY: 7-10 Calendar Days Not Stated 5 Calendar Days 3-21 Calendar Days
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Title:

Annual Supply of Fire Hydrants

Bid No: 2010-049

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Date:  February 11, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Municipal Water Works EJIW - Oklahoma Sales
Hughes Supply Inc. Supply, LP Branch Hydraflo, Inc.
ITEM QTY |[UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED

1 25| ea |5' Bury Fire Hydrant 1,425.00 35,625.00 1,500.00 37,500.00 No Bid No Bid
2 25| ea |4' Bury Fire Hydrant 1,362.00 34,050.00 1,442.20 36,055.00 No Bid No Bid
3 6| ea [3'Bury Fire Hydrant 1,299.00 7,794.00 1,329.00 7,974.00 No Bid No Bid

GROSS TOTAL: $  77,469.00 $  81,529.00

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL: $  77,469.00 $ 81,529.00 No Bid No Bid

TERMS: Net 30 Net 30

DELIVERY: 7-14 Calendar Days 7 Calendar Days
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Title: Annual Supply of Fire Hydrants
Bid No: 2010-049

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Date:  February 11, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Mueller Service Co.
ITEM QTY | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED

1 25| ea |5'Bury Fire Hydrant No Bid
2 25| ea |4' Bury Fire Hydrant No Bid
3 6| ea [3'Bury Fire Hydrant No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL: No Bid

TERMS:

DELIVERY:
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	As Awarded

