
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATIONTitle:

Bid No:
Date:

ITEM QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1 80 M No Bid 188.17         15,053.60       148.90       11,912.00       180.42         14,433.60       

2 5 M No Bid 230.19         1,150.95         292.90       1,464.50         220.84         1,104.20         

3 60 M No Bid 195.70         11,742.00       185.90       11,154.00       187.63         11,257.80       

4 10 M No Bid 218.28         2,182.80         204.40       2,044.00         213.69         2,136.90         

5 2 M No Bid 190.01         380.02            177.50       355.00            194.45         388.90            
6 3 M No Bid 271.44         814.32            244.90       734.70            260.42         781.26            

7 2 M No Bid 217.16         434.32            178.90       357.80            210.53         421.06            
8 5 M No Bid 228.01         1,140.05         218.80       1,094.00         221.06         1,105.30         
9 60 M No Bid 284.95         17,097.00       277.50       16,650.00       278.95         16,737.00       

10 2 M No Bid 228.01         456.02            No Bid 218.75         437.50            
11 10 M 532.00      5,320.00         No Bid 508.00       5,080.00         No Bid
12 10 M 532.00      5,320.00         No Bid 508.00       5,080.00         No Bid
13 4 M 532.00      2,128.00         No Bid 508.00       2,032.00         No Bid
14 4 M 532.00      2,128.00         No Bid 508.00       2,032.00         No Bid

14,896.00       50,451.08       59,990.00       48,803.52       

1 10 M No Bid 301.08         3,010.80         238.90       2,389.00         294.74         2,947.40         

2 1 M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 15 M No Bid 274.19         4,112.85         274.40       4,116.00         268.43         4,026.45         

4 10 M No Bid 311.83         3,118.30         304.50       3,045.00         305.27         3,052.70         

5 1 M No Bid 274.19         274.19            No Bid 277.18         277.18            

6 1 M No Bid 249.73         249.73            No Bid 255.56         255.56            

7 1 M No Bid 260.59         260.59            379.90       379.90            260.87         260.87            

8 20 M No Bid 456.99         9,139.80         668.00       13,360.00       461.96         9,239.20         

9 5 M No Bid 521.51         2,607.55         356.00       1,780.00         505.21         2,526.05         

10 2 M No Bid 387.10         774.20            2,320.00    4,640.00         378.95         757.90            

11 3.500 M No Bid 645.16         2,258.06         698.90       2,446.15         652.18         2,282.63         
No Bid 25,806.07       32,156.05       25,625.94       

 532.00             500.00             -                   

GROSS TOTAL: 10,640.00$     17,525.44$     51,515.50$     
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: 10,640.00$     17,525.44$     51,515.50$     
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Net 30 Net 30

Awarded Bid Awarded Bid

45 Calendar Days 120 Calendar Days 30 Calendar Days

Minimum Order

Net 30

Twelve (12) Gauge Slug-Sabot Federal, Winchester or Remington ONLY
.308 168 Grain Boattail Hollow Point Match King, Nickel Case, Federal, 
Winchester or Remington ONLY

Group II Total:

Awarded Bid

357 Magnum 180 Grain Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester "S357P" ONLY
.380 ACP 95 Grain, Any Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester, 
Federal or Remington

.223 69-Grain Boattail Hollow Point, Winchester, Federal or Remington

Twelve (12) Gauge 00 Standard Buck Federal LE132 or Winchester

10mm 175 Grain Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester, Federal or Remington
.40 S&W 180 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester "T: Series 
RA40T ONLY
.45 ACP 230 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester "T" Series 
RA45T ONLY
38 Special 130 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester "SXT" 
ONLY

Group I Total:

GROUP II
9mm 147 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester, "T" Series 
RA9T ONLY

Simmunition - 9mm Grain - 1,000 Rounds - Red 
Simmunition - 9mm Grain - 1,000 Rounds - Blue 
Simmunition - 9mm Grain - 1,000 Rounds - Yellow 
Simmunition - 9mm Grain - 1,000 Rounds - Green 

.380 ACP any Weight FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington 
ONLY
.357 Sig 125 Grain FMJ ONLY
.223 55 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington ONLY
Twelve (12) Gauge 2-3/4", #6, 7-1/2, 8 or 9 Shot Federal, Winchester or 
Remington ONLY

.40 S&W 155-180 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington 
ONLY

.45 ACP 230 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington ONLY
38 Special 147-158 Grain FMJ or Lead Bullet Federal, Winchester or 
Remington ONLY 
.357 Magnum 110-180 Grain FMJ, Winchester or Remington ONLY

DESCRIPTION
GROUP I

9mm 147 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington ONLY
10mm 175-180 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington 
ONLY

TACnologies, Ltd. Barney's Police Supplies GT Distributors, Inc. Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

Annual Supply of Ammunition
2010-048
January 28, 2010 2:00 p.m.
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1 80 M 180.00      14,400.00       

2 5 M 375.00      1,875.00         

3 60 M 190.00      11,400.00       

4 10 M 266.00      2,660.00         

5 2 M 215.00      430.00            
6 3 M 254.00      762.00            

7 2 M 206.00      412.00            
8 5 M 298.00      1,490.00         
9 60 M 348.00      20,880.00       

10 2 M 235.00      470.00            
11 10 M No Bid
12 10 M No Bid
13 4 M No Bid
14 4 M No Bid

 54,779.00       
 

1 10 M 276.00      2,760.00         

2 1 M 375.00      375.00            

3 15 M 299.00      4,485.00         

4 10 M 349.00      3,490.00         

5 1 M 277.00      277.00            

6 1 M 297.00      297.00            

7 1 M 386.00      386.00            

8 20 M 600.00      12,000.00       

9 5 M 415.00      2,075.00         

10 2 M 415.00      830.00            

11 3.500 M 693.00      2,425.50         
29,400.50       

 100.00            

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

 Precision Delta Corp.  

Minimum Order

Twelve (12) Gauge Slug-Sabot Federal, Winchester or Remington ONLY
.308 168 Grain Boattail Hollow Point Match King, Nickel Case, Federal, 
Winchester or Remington ONLY

Group II Total:

357 Magnum 180 Grain Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester "S357P" ONLY
.380 ACP 95 Grain, Any Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester, 
Federal or Remington

.223 69-Grain Boattail Hollow Point, Winchester, Federal or Remington

Twelve (12) Gauge 00 Standard Buck Federal LE132 or Winchester

10mm 175 Grain Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester, Federal or Remington
.40 S&W 180 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester "T: Series 
RA40T ONLY
.45 ACP 230 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester "T" Series 
RA45T ONLY
38 Special 130 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester "SXT" 
ONLY

Group I Total:

GROUP II
9mm 147 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point Bullet, Winchester, "T" Series 
RA9T ONLY

Simmunition - 9mm Grain - 1,000 Rounds - Red 
Simmunition - 9mm Grain - 1,000 Rounds - Blue
Simmunition - 9mm Grain - 1,000 Rounds - Yellow
Simmunition - 9mm Grain - 1,000 Rounds - Green 

.380 ACP any Weight FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington 
ONLY
.357 Sig 125 Grain FMJ ONLY
.223 55 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington ONLY
Twelve (12) Gauge 2-3/4", #6, 7-1/2, 8 or 9 Shot Federal, Winchester or 
Remington ONLY

.40 S&W 155-180 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington 
ONLY

.45 ACP 230 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington ONLY
38 Special 147-158 Grain FMJ or Lead Bullet Federal, Winchester or 
Remington ONLY 
.357 Magnum 110-180 Grain FMJ, Winchester or Remington ONLY

DESCRIPTION
GROUP I

9mm 147 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington ONLY
10mm 175-180 Grain FMJ Bullet Federal, Winchester or Remington 
ONLY

Annual Supply of Ammunition
2010-048
January 28, 2010 2:00 p.m.
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