Construction of Twelve Traffic Signal Pole

Formal Bid Tabulation

Title:  Foundations
Bid No: 2010-042
Date: January 28, 2010 2:00 p.m.
Estrada Concrete Company,
LLC Durable Specialties, Inc. FID, Inc. Techline, Inc.
ITEM | QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT [EXTENDED
1 2| ea [TxDOT Type 24-A Traffic Sighal Foundation, 24-inch dia., 6 feet 2,000.00 4,000.00 1,150.00 2,300.00 [ 5,475.10 10,950.20 No Bid
2 8| ea [TxDOT Type 36-A Traffic Signal Foundation, 36-inch dia., 12 feet 2,600.00 20,800.00 3,750.00 30,000.00 6,851.80 54,814.40 No Bid
3 2| ea [TxDOT Type 36-B Traffic Signal Foundation, 36-inch dia., 14 feet 2,600.00 5,200.00 4,050.00 8,100.00 [ 7,150.80 14,301.60 No Bid
Awarded Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $ 30,000.00 $ 40,400.00 $80,066.20 No Bid
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $ 30,000.00 $ 40,400.00 $80,066.20 No Bid
TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY: 45 Calendar Days Not Stated 60 Calendar Days
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