
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED
1 7000 FT No Bid 3.61        25,270.00         3.65        25,550.00         3.72         26,040.00         
2 3000 FT No Bid 6.21        18,630.00         6.13        18,390.00         6.37         19,110.00         
3 52 EA 402.00     20,904.00         358.00     18,616.00         385.00     20,020.00         358.00     18,616.00         
4 10 EA 624.00     6,240.00           569.00     5,690.00           581.64     5,816.40           569.00     5,690.00           
5 27 EA No Bid 140.00     3,780.00           133.21     3,596.67           141.00     3,807.00           
6 15 EA No Bid 174.25     2,613.75           166.86     2,502.90           174.50     2,617.50           
7 6 EA No Bid 185.00     1,110.00           163.12     978.72              164.00     984.00              
8 2 EA No Bid 175.00     350.00              143.02     286.04              169.85     339.70              
9 33 EA No Bid 79.99       2,639.67           69.64       2,298.12           80.00       2,640.00           

10 2 EA No Bid 101.75     203.50              91.61       183.22              102.00     204.00              
11 63 EA No Bid 32.74       2,062.62           24.91       1,569.33           30.38       1,913.94           
12 52 EA No Bid 27.31       1,420.12           19.71       1,024.92           25.50       1,326.00           
13 20 EA No Bid 43.75       875.00              36.85       737.00              41.63       832.60              
14 2 EA No Bid 37.25       74.50                30.06       60.12                35.63       71.26                
15 21 EA No Bid 102.75     2,157.75           93.48       1,963.08           103.00     2,163.00           

16 169 EA No Bid 37.84       6,394.96           40.25       6,802.25           38.52       6,509.88           

17 70 EA No Bid 44.10       3,087.00           47.70       3,339.00           45.63       3,194.10           

GROSS TOTAL: 27,144.00$       94,974.87$       95,117.77$       96,058.98$       
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: 27,144.00$       94,974.87$       95,117.77$       96,058.98$       
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

2010-028
October 29, 2009 2:00 p.m.

Purchase of 6" and 8" Class-200, DR-14 PVC Water 
Pipe and Supplies

J & S Valve, Inc
Municipal Water Works 

Supply, LP
HD Supply Waterworks, 

LTD. Morrison Supply Company
DESCRIPTION

6 inch PVC Class - 200, DR 14, Water Pipe
8 inch PVC Class - 200, DR 14, Water Pipe
6 inch Resilient Seat - M.J. Gate Valves C-515 Ductile Body Valves
8 inch Resilient Seat - M.J. Gate Valves C-515 Ductile Body Valves
6 inch - M.J. Ductile Anchored Tees w/Bolt Packs
8 x 8 x 6 - M.J. Ductile Anchored Tees w/Bolt Packs
6 inch - M.J. Ductile Cross w/Bolt Packs
8 x 6 inch - M.J. Ductile Cross w/Bolt Packs
6 inch x 12 inch M.J. Ductile Solid Sleeves w/Bolt Packs
8 inch x 12 inch M.J. Ductile Solid Sleeves w/Bolt Packs
6 inch Mega Lugs for PVC Class 200 - DR 14 w/Bolt Packs
6 inch Mega Lugs for Cast Iron Water Pipe w/Bolt Packs
8 inch Mega Lugs for PVC Class 200 - DR 14 w/Bolt Packs
8 inch Mega Lugs for Cast Iron Water Pipe w/Bolt Packs
6 inch x 13 inch  - M.J. Anchored Nipples w/Bolt Packs
6 inch x 3/4 inch Epoxy Coated Stainless Steel Double Band Service 
Saddles
8 inch x 3/4 inch Epoxy Coated Stainless Steel Double Band Service 
Saddles

1/2% 10 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
3 Calendar Days 14 Calendar Days 14-21 Calendar Days 10 Calendar Days

Awarded Bid

Page 1 of 3



CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED
1 7000 FT 3.59         25,130.00         3.72        26,040.00         3.75        26,250.00         6.23         43,631.00         
2 3000 FT 6.17         18,510.00         6.39        19,170.00         6.45        19,350.00         9.21         27,633.00         
3 52 EA 372.00     19,344.00         362.48     18,848.96         363.00     18,876.00         514.25     26,741.00         
4 10 EA 582.00     5,820.00           568.80     5,688.00           571.00     5,710.00           799.70     7,997.00           
5 27 EA 150.00     4,050.00           153.75     4,151.25           144.00     3,888.00           125.83     3,397.49           
6 15 EA 184.00     2,760.00           187.94     2,819.10           176.00     2,640.00           125.83     1,887.50           
7 6 EA 202.00     1,212.00           190.97     1,145.82           178.00     1,068.00           143.61     861.67              
8 2 EA 184.00     368.00              173.11     346.22              160.00     320.00              135.00     270.00              
9 33 EA 89.00       2,937.00           83.95       2,770.35           79.00       2,607.00           64.72       2,135.76           

10 2 EA 136.00     272.00              106.82     213.64              100.00     200.00              81.11       162.22              
11 63 EA 35.00       2,205.00           32.80       2,066.40           32.00       2,016.00           51.46       3,241.73           
12 52 EA 30.00       1,560.00           27.68       1,439.36           27.00       1,404.00           44.12       2,294.24           
13 20 EA 48.00       960.00              45.37       907.40              44.00       880.00              69.54       1,390.88           
14 2 EA 43.00       86.00                39.55       79.10                36.00       72.00                59.96       119.91              
15 21 EA 112.00     2,352.00           107.03     2,247.63           100.50     2,110.50           55.56       1,166.68           

16 169 EA 35.25       5,957.25           37.47       6,332.43           42.00       7,098.00           No Bid

17 70 EA 41.75       2,922.50           44.28       3,099.60           50.50       3,535.00           No Bid

GROSS TOTAL: 96,445.75$       97,365.26$       98,024.50$       122,930.07$     
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: 96,445.75$       97,365.26$       98,024.50$       122,930.07$     
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Net 30 Days Net 30 Days 2% Net 30 Days
15 Calendar Days 7-10 Calendar Days 14 Calendar Days 30 Calendar Days

6 inch - M.J. Ductile Cross w/Bolt Packs
8 x 6 inch - M.J. Ductile Cross w/Bolt Packs

Net 30 Days

6 inch x 12 inch M.J. Ductile Solid Sleeves w/Bolt Packs
8 inch x 12 inch M.J. Ductile Solid Sleeves w/Bolt Packs
6 inch Mega Lugs for PVC Class 200 - DR 14 w/Bolt Packs
6 inch Mega Lugs for Cast Iron Water Pipe w/Bolt Packs
8 inch Mega Lugs for PVC Class 200 - DR 14 w/Bolt Packs
8 inch Mega Lugs for Cast Iron Water Pipe w/Bolt Packs

6 inch Resilient Seat - M.J. Gate Valves C-515 Ductile Body Valves
8 inch Resilient Seat - M.J. Gate Valves C-515 Ductile Body Valves
6 inch - M.J. Ductile Anchored Tees w/Bolt Packs
8 x 8 x 6 - M.J. Ductile Anchored Tees w/Bolt Packs

ACT Pipe and Supply Ferguson Waterworks Mainline Supply Company All-Tex Pipe and Supply

Purchase of 6" and 8" Class-200, DR-14 PVC Water 
Pipe and Supplies

DESCRIPTION
6 inch PVC Class - 200, DR 14, Water Pipe
8 inch PVC Class - 200, DR 14, Water Pipe

2010-028
October 29, 2009 2:00 p.m.

6 inch x 13 inch  - M.J. Anchored Nipples w/Bolt Packs
6 inch x 3/4 inch Epoxy Coated Stainless Steel Double Band Service 
Saddles
8 inch x 3/4 inch Epoxy Coated Stainless Steel Double Band Service 
Saddles
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED
1 7000 FT No Bid No Bid
2 3000 FT No Bid No Bid
3 52 EA No Bid No Bid
4 10 EA No Bid No Bid
5 27 EA No Bid No Bid
6 15 EA No Bid No Bid
7 6 EA No Bid No Bid
8 2 EA No Bid No Bid
9 33 EA No Bid No Bid

10 2 EA No Bid No Bid
11 63 EA No Bid No Bid
12 52 EA No Bid No Bid
13 20 EA No Bid No Bid
14 2 EA No Bid No Bid
15 21 EA No Bid No Bid

16 169 EA No Bid No Bid

17 70 EA No Bid No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: No Bid No Bid
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

At Battery Company GCA Services Group
DESCRIPTION

6 inch PVC Class - 200, DR 14, Water Pipe
8 inch PVC Class - 200, DR 14, Water Pipe

Purchase of 6" and 8" Class-200, DR-14 PVC Water 
Pipe and Supplies
2010-028
October 29, 2009 2:00 p.m.

6 inch Resilient Seat - M.J. Gate Valves C-515 Ductile Body Valves
8 inch Resilient Seat - M.J. Gate Valves C-515 Ductile Body Valves
6 inch - M.J. Ductile Anchored Tees w/Bolt Packs
8 x 8 x 6 - M.J. Ductile Anchored Tees w/Bolt Packs
6 inch - M.J. Ductile Cross w/Bolt Packs
8 x 6 inch - M.J. Ductile Cross w/Bolt Packs
6 inch x 12 inch M.J. Ductile Solid Sleeves w/Bolt Packs
8 inch x 12 inch M.J. Ductile Solid Sleeves w/Bolt Packs
6 inch Mega Lugs for PVC Class 200 - DR 14 w/Bolt Packs
6 inch Mega Lugs for Cast Iron Water Pipe w/Bolt Packs
8 inch Mega Lugs for PVC Class 200 - DR 14 w/Bolt Packs
8 inch Mega Lugs for Cast Iron Water Pipe w/Bolt Packs
6 inch x 13 inch  - M.J. Anchored Nipples w/Bolt Packs
6 inch x 3/4 inch Epoxy Coated Stainless Steel Double Band Service 
Saddles
8 inch x 3/4 inch Epoxy Coated Stainless Steel Double Band Service 
Saddles
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