CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Supply of Concrete
Bid No: 2010-002
Date:  October 15, 2009 2:00 p.m.
Lattimore Materials Co. Treffinger Inc. dba Collins
Lattimore Materials Co. (Alternate) Redi Mix Concrete Concrete
ITEM QTY |UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
1 3500 cy [6-Sack 3600 PSI Concrete 72.00 252,000.00 72.00 252,000.00 74.00 259,000.00 78.50 274,750.00
2 180 cy [Rapid Set Concrete No Bid 102.00 18,360.00 No Bid 160.00 28,800.00
Awarded Bid Awarded Bid Awarded Bid Awarded Bid
Primary - Item 1 Primary - Item 2 Secondary - Iltem 1 Secondary - ltem 2
GROSS TOTAL: $ 252,000.00 $  18,360.00 $ 259,000.00 $  28,800.00
LESS DISCOUNT: (864.00)
NET TOTAL: $ 252,000.00 $  18,360.00 $ 259,000.00 $  27,936.00
TERMS: Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days 3% 5 Days
DELIVERY: 1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day 1 Calendar Day
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Title: Annual Supply of Concrete
Bid No: 2010-002

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Date:  October 15, 2009 2:00 p.m.
TXI Operations B & B Ready Mix, Inc. American Safety Util. Corp. | CMC Construction Services
ITEM QTY | UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
1 3500 cy |6-Sack 3600 PSI Concrete 78.00 273,000.00 80.00 280,000.00 No Bid No Bid
2 180| cy |Rapid Set Concrete No Bid 185.00 33,300.00 No Bid No Bid
GROSS TOTAL: $ 273,000.00 $ 313,300.00
LESS DISCOUNT: (15,665.00)
NET TOTAL: $ 273,000.00 $ 297,635.00 No Bid No Bid
TERMS: Net 30 Days 5% 10 Days
DELIVERY: Not Stated Not Stated
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