Title:
Bid No:
Date:

Annual Purchase of LED llluminated Street Signs

RFP 2010-004

June 17, 2010

2:00 p.m.

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Dynamic Vision Company,

Inc.

Republic ITS

Southern Manufacturing

Control Technologies of
Central FL Inc.

ITEM

QTY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

GROUP |

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 78-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 78-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,400.00

1,400.00

1,188.00

1,188.00

1,681.00

1,681.00

1,400.00

1,400.00

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 84-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 84-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,400.00

1,400.00

1,335.00

1,335.00

1,731.00

1,731.00

1,550.00

1,550.00

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 90-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 90-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,350.00

1,350.00

1,335.00

1,335.00

1,781.00

1,781.00

1,550.00

1,550.00

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 96-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 96-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,350.00

9,450.00

1,480.00

10,360.00

1,831.00

12,817.00

1,720.00

12,040.00

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 102-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 102-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,600.00

6,400.00

1,780.00

7,120.00

1,859.00

7,436.00

2,080.00

8,320.00

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 108-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 108-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,600.00

1,600.00

1,930.00

1,930.00

1,909.00

1,909.00

2,240.00

2,240.00

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 114-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 114-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,600.00

3,200.00

1,930.00

3,860.00

2,006.00

4,012.00

2,240.00

4,480.00

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 120-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 120-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,600.00

3,200.00

2,095.00

4,190.00

2,056.00

4,112.00

2,440.00

4,880.00

Group |, Items 1 through 8, are for specific sized signs. There are times
when the city needs "in-between"” sizes of signs. Bidder shall provide a
cost factor of pricing per inch. Row's Logo - LED illuminated street sign
assembly, varying lengths, BLACK frame, price per inch increment,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

142

142

22.00

22.00

50.00

50.00

20.65

20.65

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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Title:
Bid No:
Date:

Annual Purchase of LED llluminated Street Signs

RFP 2010-004

June 17, 2010

2:00 p.m.

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Dynamic Vision Company,
Inc.

Republic ITS

Southern Manufacturing

Control Technologies of
Central FL Inc.

ITEM

Q1Y

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

UNIT EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT EXTENDED

GROUP I

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 78-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 78-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,350.00 1,350.00

1,188.00

1,188.00

1,681.00

1,681.00

1,400.00 1,400.00

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 84-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 84-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,350.00 5,400.00

1,335.00

5,340.00

1,731.00

6,924.00

1,550.00 6,200.00

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 90-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 90-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,350.00 1,350.00

1,335.00

1,335.00

1,781.00

1,781.00

1,550.00 1,550.00

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 96-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 96-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,350.00 1,350.00

1,480.00

1,480.00

1,831.00

1,831.00

1,720.00 1,720.00

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 102-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 102-inch by 18-inch sign size including rame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,600.00 1,600.00

1,780.00

1,780.00

1,859.00

1,859.00

2,080.00 2,080.00

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 108-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 108-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,600.00 3,200.00

1,930.00

3,860.00

1,909.00

3,818.00

2,240.00 4,480.00

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 114-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 114-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,600.00 3,200.00

1,930.00

3,860.00

2,006.00

4,012.00

2,240.00 4,480.00

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 120-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 120-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,600.00 3,200.00

2,095.00

4,190.00

2,056.00

4,112.00

2,440.00 4,880.00

Group Il, Items 1 through 8, are for specific sized signs. There are times|
when the city needs "in-between"” sizes of signs. Bidder shall provide a
cost factor of pricing per inch. City of Mesquite Logo - LED illuminated
street sign assembly, varying lengths, NO COLOR frame, price per inch
increment, complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac
mounting hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

142 142

22.00

22.00

50.00

50.00

20.65 20.65

Minimum dollar amount per order|

$ 1,500.00

$

10,000.00

$ 5,000.00

GROSS TOTAL:

$  48,652.84

$

54,395.00

$

61,597.00

63,291.30

LESS DISCOUNT:

NET TOTAL:

$  48,652.84

$

54,395.00

$

61,597.00

$
$ (1,265.83)
$  62,025.47

TERMS:

Net 30

Net 30

Net 30

2% 10 Days

DELIVERY:

Stock / 60 Calendar Days

28-42 Calendar

Days

30 Calendar Days

30-45 ARO Calendar Days
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Title:
Bid No:
Date:

Annual Purchase of LED llluminated Street Signs

RFP 2010-004

June 17, 2010

2:00 p.m.

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

West Central Signs, Inc. dba

Signstar

Texas Highway Products LTD

Pro-Lite

Computec Traffic Systems,

Inc.

ITEM

QTY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

GROUP |

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 78-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 78-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,583.25 1,583.25

1,890.00

1,890.00

2,128.54 2,128.54

2,158.70

2,158.70

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 84-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 84-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,693.50 1,693.50

2,030.00

2,030.00

2,238.97 2,238.97

2,303.60

2,303.60

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 90-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 90-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,803.75 1,803.75

2,050.00

2,050.00

2,387.20 2,387.20

2,448.50

2,448.50

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 96-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 96-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

1,914.00 13,398.00

2,065.00

14,455.00

2,529.12 17,703.84

2,593.40

18,153.80

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 102-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 102-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

2,024.25 8,097.00

2,295.00

9,180.00

2,664.75 10,659.00

2,738.30

10,953.20

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 108-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 108-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

2,134.50 2,134.50

2,525.00

2,525.00

2,812.98 2,812.98

2,883.20

2,883.20

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 114-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 114-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

2,244.75 4,489.50

2,610.00

5,220.00

2,942.30 5,884.60

3,028.10

6,056.20

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 120-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 120-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

2,355.00 4,710.00

2,695.00

5,390.00

3,071.63 6,143.26

2,738.30

5,476.60

when the city needs "in-between"” sizes of signs. Bidder shall provide a
cost factor of pricing per inch. Row's Logo - LED illuminated street sign
assembly, varying lengths, BLACK frame, price per inch increment,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting

20.13 20.13

26.25

26.25

152 152

27.50

27.50

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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Title:
Bid No:
Date:

Annual Purchase of LED llluminated Street Signs

RFP 2010-004

June 17, 2010

2:00 p.m.

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

West Central Signs, Inc. dba
Signstar

Texas Highway Products LTD

Pro-Lite

Computec Traffic Systems,
Inc.

ITEM

QTY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

UNIT EXTENDED

UNIT EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT EXTENDED

GROUP I

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 78-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 78-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,583.25 1,583.25

1,885.00 1,885.00

2,128.54

2,128.54

2,158.70 2,158.70

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 84-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 84-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,693.50 6,774.00

2,025.00 8,100.00

2,238.97

8,955.88

2,303.60 9,214.40

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 90-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 90-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,803.75 1,803.75

2,045.00 2,045.00

2,387.20

2,387.20

2,448.50 2,448.50

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 96-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 96-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

1,914.00 1,914.00

2,060.00 2,060.00

2,529.12

2,529.12

2,593.40 2,593.40

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 102-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 102-inch by 18-inch sign size including rame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

2,024.25 2,024.25

2,290.00 2,290.00

2,664.75

2,664.75

2,738.30 2,738.30

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 114-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 114-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

2,134.50 4,269.00

2,520.00 5,040.00

2,812.98

5,625.96

2,883.20 5,766.40

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 120-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 120-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

2,244.75 4,489.50

2,605.00 5,210.00

2,942.30

5,884.60

3,028.10 6,056.20

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 78-inch,
BLACK frame, for a 78-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

2,355.00 4,710.00

2,690.00 5,380.00

3,071.63

6,143.26

2,738.30 5,476.60

when the city needs "in-between"” sizes of signs. Bidder shall provide a
cost factor of pricing per inch. City of Mesquite Logo - LED illuminated
street sign assembly, varying lengths, NO COLOR frame, price per inch
increment, complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac

20.13 20.13

26.15 26.15

152

152

27.50 27.50

Minimum dollar amount per order|

$ 500.00

1,890.00

2,128.54

2,100.00

GROSS TOTAL:

$  65,517.51

$  74,802.40

$

86,280.74

$  86,941.30

LESS DISCOUNT:

(655.18)

NET TOTAL:

$  64,862.33

$  74,802.40

$

86,280.74

$  86,941.30

TERMS:

1% 10 Days

Net 30

Net 30

Net 30

DELIVERY:

30 Calendar Days

35 Calendar Days

90 Calendar Days

40 Calendar Days
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Title:
Bid No:
Date:

Annual Purchase of LED llluminated Street Signs

RFP 2010-004

June 17, 2010

2:00 p.m.

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Texas Correctional Industries

ITEM

QTY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

UNIT EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

GROUP |

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 78-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 78-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 84-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 84-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 90-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 90-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 96-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 96-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

Row's Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 102-inch, BLACK
frame, for a 102-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame, complete with
backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting hardware and
internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 108-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 108-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 114-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 114-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 120-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 120-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

when the city needs "in-between"” sizes of signs. Bidder shall provide a
cost factor of pricing per inch. Row's Logo - LED illuminated street sign
assembly, varying lengths, BLACK frame, price per inch increment,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting

No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:
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Title:
Bid No:
Date:

Annual Purchase of LED llluminated Street Signs

RFP 2010-004

June 17, 2010

2:00 p.m.

CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Texas Correctional Industries

ITEM

QTY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

UNIT EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

UNIT

EXTENDED

GROUP I

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 78-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 78-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 84-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 84-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 90-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 90-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 96-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 96-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 102-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 102-inch by 18-inch sign size including rame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 108-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 108-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 114-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 114-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

EA

City of Mesquite Logo - LED llluminated street sign assembly, 120-inch,
NO COLOR frame, for a 120-inch by 18-inch sign size including frame,
complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac mounting
hardware and internal photocell with junction box.

No Bid

when the city needs "in-between"” sizes of signs. Bidder shall provide a
cost factor of pricing per inch. City of Mesquite Logo - LED illuminated
street sign assembly, varying lengths, NO COLOR frame, price per inch
increment, complete with backbrace rigid mount inclusive of Astrobrac

No Bid

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

No Bid

No Bid
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