
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Page 1 of 8

Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1. 1 each 1,422.00   1,422.00     No Bid No Bid No Bid 
2. 2 each 630.00      1,260.00     No Bid No Bid 593.00     1,186.00      
3. 2 each 167.00      334.00        No Bid No Bid 155.00     310.00         
4. 4 each 35.00        140.00        No Bid No Bid 31.00       124.00         
5. 4 each 22.00        88.00          No Bid No Bid 24.00       96.00           
6. 4 each 19.00        76.00          No Bid No Bid 19.00       76.00           
7. 2 each 964.00      1,928.00     No Bid No Bid No Bid 
8. 2 each 69.00        138.00        No Bid No Bid 68.00       136.00         
9. 2 each 87.00        174.00        No Bid No Bid 81.00       162.00         

5,560.00     No Bid No Bid 2,090.00      

1. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

1. 1 each No Bid No Bid 2,154.00   2,154.00     2,291.00  2,291.00      
2. 1 each No Bid No Bid 1,236.00   1,236.00     1,353.00  1,353.00      
3. 1 each No Bid No Bid 2,067.00   2,067.00     2,411.00  2,411.00      
4. 1 each No Bid No Bid 1,442.00   1,442.00     1,641.00  1,641.00      
5. 3 each No Bid No Bid 69.88        209.64        99.00       297.00         
6. 1 each No Bid No Bid 469.00      469.00        486.00     486.00         
7. 2 each No Bid No Bid 149.00      298.00        151.00     302.00         
8. 1 each No Bid No Bid 38.90        38.90          39.00       39.00           

No Bid No Bid 7,914.54     8,820.00      

1. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
2. 2 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Group C: Total 

Group D: Total

Canon Speedlite 580 EX II
32GB Extreme Compact Flash Memory Card

Group D: Photography Studio Equipment

Group A: Total

Group B:Video Storage
Drobo 24TB (8x3TB) Drobo B800i iSCSI SAN Hard Drive Array

Canon EF 16-35mm f/2.8L II USM Autofocus Lens 
77mm UV Haze 010 F-Pro MRC Filter

Sennheiser HD280 Pro Circumaural Closed-Back Monitor 

Sennheiser G3 Combo (A) EK100/SKP100/SK100/ME2/REG
Electro-Voice RE50/B Shock-MTD DYN Omni Mike (BLK/REG)

Group A: Audio

Integra Pro Plus 500 Two moonlight kits
77mm UV Protector Filter

Canon EF 70-200mm f/2.8L IS II USM Telephoto Zoom Lens

Pearstone XLR/M to XLR/F Cable 25'/REG
Rode NTG-3 PRCSN RF-Biasd SHTGN MIC/KIT/REG

Group C: Camera (Video / still images) and lenses

Pearstone XLR/M to XLR/F Cable 100'/REG 

January 12, 2012 2:00 p.m.

Pearstone XLR/M to CLR/F Cable 50'/REG

Rode NTG-3 Sig. Utltimate Shotgun Kit/REG

DESCRIPTION

 Purchase of Cameras, Video Equipment and 
Accessories 
2012-058

Canon Delux Backpack 200 EG

Canon EOS 5D Mark II Digital Camera (Body Only)
Canon Zoom Wide Angle-Telephoto EF 24-70mm f/2.8L USM 

Group B: Total

Logitech Speaker System Z323 (2 sets)

Virtualsets.com, Inc.
Washington Professional 

Systems Focus Camera VSA, Inc.
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1. 2 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
2. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
3. 10 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
4. 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
5. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
6. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
7. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
8. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

1. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
2. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
3. 1 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

1. 2 each No Bid 659.00    1,318.00        No Bid No Bid 
2. 2 each No Bid 659.00    1,318.00        No Bid No Bid 
3. 2 each No Bid 759.00    1,518.00        No Bid No Bid 

No Bid 4,154.00        No Bid No Bid 

1. 2 each No Bid 748.00    1,496.00        No Bid No Bid 

No Bid 1,496.00        No Bid No Bid 

GROSS TOTAL: 5,560.00$   5,650.00$      7,914.54$   10,910.00$  
LESS DISCOUNT: (28.25)           
NET TOTAL: 5,560.00$   5,621.75$      7,914.54$   10,910.00$  
TERMS:
DELIVERY: 30 Calendar Days 5 Calendar Days 5-8 Calendar Days 30 Calendar Days

Net 30 0.5% 10 Calendar Days Net 30 Net 30

Group F: Backdrops
Delta 1 Muslin Background - 10x20'-Bright White

DESCRIPTION

Focus Camera VSA, Inc.

 Purchase of Cameras, Video Equipment and 
Accessories 
2012-058
January 12, 2012 2:00 p.m.

Washington Professional 
Systems Virtualsets.com, Inc.

Collapsible Reflector-4x6' Oval-Silver/White
L-758C Cine Light Meter

Group E: Total

Gaffer DMX Two 4 Bank Kit (120V)
Diva-Lite 400 Two Fluorescent light Kit (120VAC)
True Match 21" 55C-K32 Compact Lamp-55W/3200K
4'Kino 800ma KF32 SFC True Match Fluorescent Lamp (6 Lamps)
Panelit Collapsible Reflector-Sunlite/Soft Silver-4x6' (1x1.8m)
Collapsible Reflector-4x6' Oval-White/Translucent

Group E: Supplemental Studio Lighting 

Effects Suite 10

Group F: Total

Group G: Software for Computers
Magic Bullet Suite 11
Keying Suite 11

Savage #14 Infinity Hand Painted Muslin Background (10x20')
Won Background Muslin Renoir Background-Vivace-10x20' (3x6m)

Group G: Total

Group H: Trapcode Suites
Trapcode Suite 11 by Red Giant Software

Group H: Total
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT

1. 1 each
2. 2 each
3. 2 each
4. 4 each
5. 4 each
6. 4 each
7. 2 each
8. 2 each
9. 2 each

1. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 1 each
3. 1 each
4. 1 each
5. 3 each
6. 1 each
7. 2 each
8. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 2 each

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Group C: Total 

Group D: Total

Canon Speedlite 580 EX II
32GB Extreme Compact Flash Memory Card

Group D: Photography Studio Equipment

Group A: Total

Group B:Video Storage
Drobo 24TB (8x3TB) Drobo B800i iSCSI SAN Hard Drive Array

Canon EF 16-35mm f/2.8L II USM Autofocus Lens 
77mm UV Haze 010 F-Pro MRC Filter

Sennheiser HD280 Pro Circumaural Closed-Back Monitor 

Sennheiser G3 Combo (A) EK100/SKP100/SK100/ME2/REG
Electro-Voice RE50/B Shock-MTD DYN Omni Mike (BLK/REG)

Group A: Audio

Integra Pro Plus 500 Two moonlight kits
77mm UV Protector Filter

Canon EF 70-200mm f/2.8L IS II USM Telephoto Zoom Lens

Pearstone XLR/M to XLR/F Cable 25'/REG
Rode NTG-3 PRCSN RF-Biasd SHTGN MIC/KIT/REG

Group C: Camera (Video / still images) and lenses

Pearstone XLR/M to XLR/F Cable 100'/REG 

January 12, 2012 2:00 p.m.

Pearstone XLR/M to CLR/F Cable 50'/REG

Rode NTG-3 Sig. Utltimate Shotgun Kit/REG

DESCRIPTION

 Purchase of Cameras, Video Equipment and 
Accessories 
2012-058

Canon Delux Backpack 200 EG

Canon EOS 5D Mark II Digital Camera (Body Only)
Canon Zoom Wide Angle-Telephoto EF 24-70mm f/2.8L USM 

Group B: Total

Logitech Speaker System Z323 (2 sets)

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1,619.98   1,619.98      No Bid 1,325.11  1,325.11      780.00     780.00            
859.98      1,719.96      No Bid 642.86     1,285.72      1,770.00  3,540.00         
189.98      379.96         No Bid 165.09     330.18         402.00     804.00            
46.98        187.92         No Bid 91.80       367.20         No Bid 
36.98        147.92         No Bid 20.36       81.44           No Bid 
34.98        139.92         No Bid 13.57       54.28           No Bid 

749.98      1,499.96      No Bid 502.04     1,004.08      1,559.00  3,118.00         
63.98        127.96         No Bid 54.03       108.06         163.70     327.40            
95.98        191.96         No Bid 82.03       164.06         222.00     444.00            

6,015.54      No Bid 4,720.13      9,013.40         

6,269.98   6,269.98      No Bid 5,422.65  5,422.65      4,077.00  4,077.00         

6,269.98      No Bid 5,422.65      4,077.00         

No Bid 2,320.00  2,320.00      2,294.90  2,294.90      2,454.00  2,454.00         
No Bid 1,399.00  1,399.00      1,356.12  1,356.12      1,420.00  1,420.00         
No Bid 2,415.00  2,415.00      2,422.45  2,422.45      2,565.00  2,565.00         
No Bid 1,645.00  1,645.00      1,646.94  1,646.94      1,712.00  1,712.00         
No Bid 58.50       175.50         71.79       215.37         58.00       174.00            
No Bid 499.00     499.00         486.15     486.15         503.88     503.88            
No Bid 111.95     223.90         64.89       129.78         146.44     292.88            
No Bid No Bid 33.33       33.33           35.56       35.56              

No Bid 8,677.40      8,585.04      9,157.32         

No Bid No Bid 1,733.67  1,733.67      No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 20.78       41.56           No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 1,775.23      No Bid 

Southern Computer 
Warehouse Compuquick, Inc.Business Services

Calumet Photographic, 
Inc.
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT

1. 2 each
2. 1 each
3. 10 each
4. 4 each
5. 1 each
6. 1 each
7. 1 each
8. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 1 each
3. 1 each

1. 2 each
2. 2 each
3. 2 each

1. 2 each

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Group F: Backdrops
Delta 1 Muslin Background - 10x20'-Bright White

DESCRIPTION

 Purchase of Cameras, Video Equipment and 
Accessories 
2012-058
January 12, 2012 2:00 p.m.

Collapsible Reflector-4x6' Oval-Silver/White
L-758C Cine Light Meter

Group E: Total

Gaffer DMX Two 4 Bank Kit (120V)
Diva-Lite 400 Two Fluorescent light Kit (120VAC)
True Match 21" 55C-K32 Compact Lamp-55W/3200K
4'Kino 800ma KF32 SFC True Match Fluorescent Lamp (6 Lamps)
Panelit Collapsible Reflector-Sunlite/Soft Silver-4x6' (1x1.8m)
Collapsible Reflector-4x6' Oval-White/Translucent

Group E: Supplemental Studio Lighting 

Effects Suite 10

Group F: Total

Group G: Software for Computers
Magic Bullet Suite 11
Keying Suite 11

Savage #14 Infinity Hand Painted Muslin Background (10x20')
Won Background Muslin Renoir Background-Vivace-10x20' (3x6m)

Group G: Total

Group H: Trapcode Suites
Trapcode Suite 11 by Red Giant Software

Group H: Total

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
No Bid 2926.6 2,926.60      No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
No Bid 38.35 153.40         No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 73.79       73.79           No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 75.38       75.38           No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 78.92       78.92           No Bid 
No Bid 825.00     825.00         819.49     819.49         No Bid 

No Bid 3,905.00      1,047.58      No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 194.85     194.85         No Bid 
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 194.85         No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 596.25     1,192.50         
No Bid No Bid No Bid 530.10     1,060.20         
No Bid No Bid No Bid 530.10     1,060.20         

No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,312.90         

No Bid No Bid No Bid 596.25     1,192.50         

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,192.50         

12,285.52$  12,582.40$  21,745.48$  26,753.12$     

12,285.52$  12,582.40$  21,745.48$  26,753.12$     

15 Calendar Days 21-50 Calendar Days 5-10 Calendar Days Not Quoted
Net 30 Net 30Net 30 Net 30

Business Services
Calumet Photographic, 

Inc.
Southern Computer 

Warehouse Compuquick, Inc.
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT

1. 1 each
2. 2 each
3. 2 each
4. 4 each
5. 4 each
6. 4 each
7. 2 each
8. 2 each
9. 2 each

1. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 1 each
3. 1 each
4. 1 each
5. 3 each
6. 1 each
7. 2 each
8. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 2 each

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Group C: Total 

Group D: Total

Canon Speedlite 580 EX II
32GB Extreme Compact Flash Memory Card

Group D: Photography Studio Equipment

Group A: Total

Group B:Video Storage
Drobo 24TB (8x3TB) Drobo B800i iSCSI SAN Hard Drive Array

Canon EF 16-35mm f/2.8L II USM Autofocus Lens 
77mm UV Haze 010 F-Pro MRC Filter

Sennheiser HD280 Pro Circumaural Closed-Back Monitor 

Sennheiser G3 Combo (A) EK100/SKP100/SK100/ME2/REG
Electro-Voice RE50/B Shock-MTD DYN Omni Mike (BLK/REG)

Group A: Audio

Integra Pro Plus 500 Two moonlight kits
77mm UV Protector Filter

Canon EF 70-200mm f/2.8L IS II USM Telephoto Zoom Lens

Pearstone XLR/M to XLR/F Cable 25'/REG
Rode NTG-3 PRCSN RF-Biasd SHTGN MIC/KIT/REG

Group C: Camera (Video / still images) and lenses

Pearstone XLR/M to XLR/F Cable 100'/REG 

January 12, 2012 2:00 p.m.

Pearstone XLR/M to CLR/F Cable 50'/REG

Rode NTG-3 Sig. Utltimate Shotgun Kit/REG

DESCRIPTION

 Purchase of Cameras, Video Equipment and 
Accessories 
2012-058

Canon Delux Backpack 200 EG

Canon EOS 5D Mark II Digital Camera (Body Only)
Canon Zoom Wide Angle-Telephoto EF 24-70mm f/2.8L USM 

Group B: Total

Logitech Speaker System Z323 (2 sets)

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1,199.95  1,199.95       No Bid 1,308.57  1,308.57        No Bid 
599.95     1,199.90       No Bid 724.50     1,449.00        No Bid 
145.00     290.00          No Bid 185.00     370.00           No Bid 
27.00       108.00          No Bid 90.00       360.00           No Bid 
18.99       75.96            No Bid 47.99       191.96           No Bid 
15.99       63.96            No Bid 31.99       127.96           No Bid 

499.00     998.00          No Bid 558.28     1,116.56        No Bid 
58.99       117.98          No Bid 69.81       139.62           No Bid 
74.00       148.00          No Bid 96.00       192.00           No Bid 

4,201.75       No Bid 5,255.67        No Bid 

3,706.76  3,706.76       No Bid 7,499.00  7,499.00        No Bid 

3,706.76       No Bid 7,499.00        No Bid 

2,149.90  2,149.90       No Bid 2,474.00  2,474.00        No Bid 
1,174.90  1,174.90       No Bid 1,149.00  1,149.00        No Bid 
1,999.90  1,999.90       No Bid 2,499.00  2,499.00        No Bid 
1,394.00  1,394.00       No Bid 1,699.00  1,699.00        No Bid 

60.00       180.00          No Bid 95.00       285.00           No Bid 
399.00     399.00          No Bid 499.00     499.00           No Bid 
139.95     279.90          No Bid 445.30     890.60           No Bid 
36.90       36.90            No Bid 55.00       55.00             No Bid 

7,614.50       No Bid 9,550.60        No Bid 

1,699.00  1,699.00       No Bid 1,470.85  1,470.85        No Bid 
11.95       23.90            No Bid 95.00       190.00           No Bid 

1,722.90       No Bid 1,660.85        No Bid 

Foto Club Enterprises, 
Inc.

B&H Photo - Video - Pro 
Audio

Global Gov Ed 
Solutions, Inc.Videotex Systems, Inc.
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT

1. 2 each
2. 1 each
3. 10 each
4. 4 each
5. 1 each
6. 1 each
7. 1 each
8. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 1 each
3. 1 each

1. 2 each
2. 2 each
3. 2 each

1. 2 each

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Group F: Backdrops
Delta 1 Muslin Background - 10x20'-Bright White

DESCRIPTION

 Purchase of Cameras, Video Equipment and 
Accessories 
2012-058
January 12, 2012 2:00 p.m.

Collapsible Reflector-4x6' Oval-Silver/White
L-758C Cine Light Meter

Group E: Total

Gaffer DMX Two 4 Bank Kit (120V)
Diva-Lite 400 Two Fluorescent light Kit (120VAC)
True Match 21" 55C-K32 Compact Lamp-55W/3200K
4'Kino 800ma KF32 SFC True Match Fluorescent Lamp (6 Lamps)
Panelit Collapsible Reflector-Sunlite/Soft Silver-4x6' (1x1.8m)
Collapsible Reflector-4x6' Oval-White/Translucent

Group E: Supplemental Studio Lighting 

Effects Suite 10

Group F: Total

Group G: Software for Computers
Magic Bullet Suite 11
Keying Suite 11

Savage #14 Infinity Hand Painted Muslin Background (10x20')
Won Background Muslin Renoir Background-Vivace-10x20' (3x6m)

Group G: Total

Group H: Trapcode Suites
Trapcode Suite 11 by Red Giant Software

Group H: Total

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

2,970.00  5,940.00       2,249.99  4,499.98        2,629.00  5,258.00        No Bid 
2,470.00  2,470.00       1,329.99  1,329.99        2,600.00  2,600.00        No Bid 

21.00       210.00          2,374.99  23,749.90      26.00       260.00           No Bid 
128.00     512.00          1,614.99  6,459.96        150.00     600.00           No Bid 
76.00       76.00            No Bid 86.05       86.05             No Bid 
73.00       73.00            No Bid 86.05       86.05             No Bid 
76.00       76.00            No Bid 86.05       86.05             No Bid 

799.90     799.90          32.99       32.99             817.00     817.00           No Bid 

10,156.90     36,072.82      9,793.15        No Bid 

111.00     111.00          No Bid 110.00     110.00           No Bid 
97.00       97.00            No Bid 190.00     190.00           No Bid 

185.00     185.00          No Bid 200.00     200.00           No Bid 

393.00          No Bid 500.00           No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 643.00     1,286.00        No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 643.00     1,286.00        No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 723.00     1,446.00        No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 4,018.00        No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 723.00     1,446.00        No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 1,446.00        No Bid 

27,795.81$   36,072.82$    39,723.27$    No Bid 

27,795.81$   36,072.82$    39,723.27$    No Bid 

14 Calendar Days 15 Calendar Days1-3 Weeks
Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

B&H Photo - Video - Pro 
Audio

Foto Club Enterprises, 
Inc. Videotex Systems, Inc.

Global Gov Ed 
Solutions, Inc.
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT

1. 1 each
2. 2 each
3. 2 each
4. 4 each
5. 4 each
6. 4 each
7. 2 each
8. 2 each
9. 2 each

1. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 1 each
3. 1 each
4. 1 each
5. 3 each
6. 1 each
7. 2 each
8. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 2 each

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Group C: Total 

Group D: Total

Canon Speedlite 580 EX II
32GB Extreme Compact Flash Memory Card

Group D: Photography Studio Equipment

Group A: Total

Group B:Video Storage
Drobo 24TB (8x3TB) Drobo B800i iSCSI SAN Hard Drive Array

Canon EF 16-35mm f/2.8L II USM Autofocus Lens 
77mm UV Haze 010 F-Pro MRC Filter

Sennheiser HD280 Pro Circumaural Closed-Back Monitor 

Sennheiser G3 Combo (A) EK100/SKP100/SK100/ME2/REG
Electro-Voice RE50/B Shock-MTD DYN Omni Mike (BLK/REG)

Group A: Audio

Integra Pro Plus 500 Two moonlight kits
77mm UV Protector Filter

Canon EF 70-200mm f/2.8L IS II USM Telephoto Zoom Lens

Pearstone XLR/M to XLR/F Cable 25'/REG
Rode NTG-3 PRCSN RF-Biasd SHTGN MIC/KIT/REG

Group C: Camera (Video / still images) and lenses

Pearstone XLR/M to XLR/F Cable 100'/REG 

January 12, 2012 2:00 p.m.

Pearstone XLR/M to CLR/F Cable 50'/REG

Rode NTG-3 Sig. Utltimate Shotgun Kit/REG

DESCRIPTION

 Purchase of Cameras, Video Equipment and 
Accessories 
2012-058

Canon Delux Backpack 200 EG

Canon EOS 5D Mark II Digital Camera (Body Only)
Canon Zoom Wide Angle-Telephoto EF 24-70mm f/2.8L USM 

Group B: Total

Logitech Speaker System Z323 (2 sets)

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

IVS, Inc. - Angeltrax
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Bid Name:
Bid Number:
Date:

ITEM  QTY UNIT

1. 2 each
2. 1 each
3. 10 each
4. 4 each
5. 1 each
6. 1 each
7. 1 each
8. 1 each

1. 1 each
2. 1 each
3. 1 each

1. 2 each
2. 2 each
3. 2 each

1. 2 each

GROSS TOTAL:
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL:
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Group F: Backdrops
Delta 1 Muslin Background - 10x20'-Bright White

DESCRIPTION

 Purchase of Cameras, Video Equipment and 
Accessories 
2012-058
January 12, 2012 2:00 p.m.

Collapsible Reflector-4x6' Oval-Silver/White
L-758C Cine Light Meter

Group E: Total

Gaffer DMX Two 4 Bank Kit (120V)
Diva-Lite 400 Two Fluorescent light Kit (120VAC)
True Match 21" 55C-K32 Compact Lamp-55W/3200K
4'Kino 800ma KF32 SFC True Match Fluorescent Lamp (6 Lamps)
Panelit Collapsible Reflector-Sunlite/Soft Silver-4x6' (1x1.8m)
Collapsible Reflector-4x6' Oval-White/Translucent

Group E: Supplemental Studio Lighting 

Effects Suite 10

Group F: Total

Group G: Software for Computers
Magic Bullet Suite 11
Keying Suite 11

Savage #14 Infinity Hand Painted Muslin Background (10x20')
Won Background Muslin Renoir Background-Vivace-10x20' (3x6m)

Group G: Total

Group H: Trapcode Suites
Trapcode Suite 11 by Red Giant Software

Group H: Total

   UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
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