
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1. 6 ea 321.65     1,929.90           650.00          3,900.00           750.00         4,500.00           485.00         2,910.00           

2. 1 ea No Bid 3,500.00       3,500.00           3,656.00      3,656.00           3,442.00      3,442.00           

3. 3 ea No Bid 3,880.00       11,640.00         4,178.00      12,534.00         3,941.00      11,823.00         

4. 1 ea No Bid 3,925.00       3,925.00           4,390.00      4,390.00           4,542.00      4,542.00           

5. 1 ea No Bid 4,450.00       4,450.00           4,890.00      4,890.00           5,009.00      5,009.00           

6. 4 ea No Bid 4,725.00       18,900.00         5,105.00      20,420.00         5,302.00      21,208.00         

7. 5 ea No Bid 10,400.00    52,000.00         10,794.00    53,970.00         12,311.00    61,555.00         

8. 4 ea No Bid 10,500.00    42,000.00         11,086.00    44,344.00         12,482.00    49,928.00         

9. 1 ea No Bid 3,900.00       3,900.00           3,650.00      3,650.00           3,448.00      3,448.00           

10. 1 ea No Bid 4,050.00       4,050.00           4,453.00      4,453.00           4,481.00      4,481.00           
 

Yes Yes Yes Yes

GROSS TOTAL: 1,929.90$         148,265.00$     156,807.00$     168,346.00$     
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: 1,929.90$         148,265.00$     156,807.00$     168,346.00$     
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 44' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Galvlanized and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock Washers, 8 Flat 
Washers) B.C. = 21 inches.

19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 44' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock 
Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 21 inches
19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 48' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts as per TXDOT 
specifications.

2010-077
June 3, 2010

12' Pedestal Pole with Base, Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor 
Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 12 3/4 
inches

2:00 p.m.

Poles with Mast Arm Assemblies

19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 32' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock 
Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 19 inches
19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 36' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock 
Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 19 inches
19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 40' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock 
Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 21 inches

Structural Steel Products

19' Pedestal Pole with a 24' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper and Powder-
coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock Washers, 
8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 19 inches

Paradigm Traffic Systems, 
Inc.

DESCRIPTION
Union Metal Corporation

Net 30

Trinity Structural Components 
LLC

19" Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 55' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts as per TXDOT 
specifications.
19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 32' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Galvanized and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock Washers, 8 Flat 
Washers) B.C. = 19 inches

Addendum

Purchase of Pedestal Poles and Traffic Signal

Net 30
30 - 45 Calendar Days 100 Calendar Days 105 Calendar Days 56 - 70 Calendar Days
Net 30 Net 30
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED

1. 6 ea No Bid No Bid

2. 1 ea No Bid No Bid

3. 3 ea No Bid No Bid

4. 1 ea No Bid No Bid

5. 1 ea No Bid No Bid

6. 4 ea No Bid No Bid

7. 5 ea No Bid No Bid

8. 4 ea No Bid No Bid

9. 1 ea No Bid No Bid

10. 1 ea No Bid No Bid
 

GROSS TOTAL: No Bid No Bid
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: No Bid No Bid
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 48' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts as per TXDOT 
specifications.
19" Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 55' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts as per TXDOT 
specifications.
19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 32' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Galvanized and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock Washers, 8 Flat 
Washers) B.C. = 19 inches

19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 32' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock 
Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 19 inches
19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 36' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock 
Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 19 inches
19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 40' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock 
Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 21 inches
19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 44' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock 
Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 21 inches

Purchase of Pedestal Poles and Traffic Signal
Poles with Mast Arm Assemblies

2010-077
June 3, 2010 2:00 p.m.

Naztec, Inc.
Assembly Fasteners/Tropic 

Fastener   

12' Pedestal Pole with Base, Powder-coated Gloss Black and Anchor 
Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock Washers, 8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 12 3/4 
inches

DESCRIPTION

19' Pedestal Pole with a 24' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper and Powder-
coated Gloss Black and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock Washers, 
8 Flat Washers) B.C. = 19 inches

19' Steel Traffic Signal Pole with a 44' Mast Arm, Vibration Damper, 
Galvlanized and Anchor Bolts (4 Bolts, 4 Nuts, 4 Lock Washers, 8 Flat 
Washers) B.C. = 21 inches.
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