CITY OF MESQUITE

BID TABULATION

Title: Annual Contract for Concrete Crushing Contractor
Bid No: 2010-060
Date:  April 8, 2010 2:00 p.m.
JP Environmental
Recycling, LLC Southwest Crushing LLC Big City Crushed Concrete
ITEM QTY [UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
Option 1
Periodic crushing at the City of Mesquite's Convenience Center,
Recycled concrete flexible base Type D, Grade 1, meeting current
TXDOT Standard Specification Item 247, Flexible Base, per
1.] 12,000| Ton |specifications 6.50 78,000.00 No Bid No Bid 7.00 84,000.00
Option 2
Constant crushing at a location of the vendor's choice. Recycled
concrete flexible base Type D, Grade 1, meeting current TxDOT
2.| 12,000| Ton |Standard Specification Item 247, Flexible Base, per specifications No Bid No Bid 7.00 84,000.00 7.00 84,000.00
Option 3
Retail Price - Vendors shall include a retail price in their bid should the
City require more flexible base than rubble it delivers. This retail price
shall only be applied at the end of the contract period if the year's
received flexible base exceeds the year's delivered rubble by more than
3. 1| Ton |10 percent by weight. No Bid No Bid 7.35 7.35 7.00 7.00
Signed Yes Yes Yes
Insurance Yes No Yes
GROSS TOTAL: $  78,000.00 $  84,007.35 $ 168,007.00
LESS DISCOUNT:
NET TOTAL: $  78,000.00 $  84,007.35 $ 168,007.00
TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
DELIVERY: 60 Calendar Days Not Stated 45 Calendar Days
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