
CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED
1 600 ea No Bid No Bid 1.89           1,134.00           1.99             1,194.00           
2 6000 ea No Bid No Bid 2.20           13,200.00         2.42             14,520.00         
3 100 bund No Bid 30.00         3,000.00           20.63         2,063.00           24.87           2,487.00           
4 500 bund No Bid 8.79           4,395.00           6.44           3,220.00           7.07             3,535.00           
5 300 bund No Bid 8.79           2,637.00           6.56           1,968.00           7.16             2,148.00           
6 10 bag No Bid No Bid 14.94         149.40              8.88             88.80                
7 10 bag No Bid No Bid 17.86         178.60              24.15           241.50              
8 15 bag No Bid No Bid 20.09         301.35              25.99           389.85              
9 500 ea No Bid No Bid 4.27           2,135.00           1.95             975.00              

10 10 bag No Bid No Bid 11.87         118.70              14.18           141.80              
11 12 rl 57.60          691.20              29.00         348.00              26.88         322.56              38.84           466.08              
12 12 rl 57.60          691.20              58.00         696.00              16.00         192.00              17.72           212.64              
13 7000 ea No Bid No Bid 3.85           26,950.00         4.13             28,910.00         

-                    100.00              500.00              -                    

GROSS TOTAL: 1,382.40$         11,076.00$       51,932.61$       55,309.67$       
LESS DISCOUNT: (13.82)               (110.76)             
NET TOTAL: 1,368.58$         10,965.24$       51,932.61$       55,309.67$       
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Minimum dollar amount per order

2010-007

3/4" x 6" x 7" Curb Ear Flexcell Expansion Joint
500 each 2-1/4" Plastic Chairs for Rebar
Black Poly, 4 Mil 20' x 100'

October 1, 2009

1/2" x 4" x 10' Flexcell Expansion Joint

2:00 p.m.

50 each 1" x 2" x 48" Wood Stakes
50 each 1" x 2" x 18" Wood Stakes
50 each 1" x 2" x 24" Wood Stakes

Annual Supply of Construction Materials

225 each 3-1/4" Plastic Chairs for Rebar
5,000 each 4-1/2" Tie Wire for Rebar
5,000 each 5-1/2" Tie Wire for Rebar

Black Poly, 4 Mil 10' x 100'
1/2" x 20' Number 4 Grade 40 Steel Rebar

FastenalRazorback Supply

3/8" x 20' Number 3 Grade 40 Steel Rebar

All American Poly
DESCRIPTION

Supply Depot

Net 30
5 - 20 Calendar Days 5 Calendar Days 2 - 3 Calendar Days 2 - 3 Calendar Days
1% 10, Net 30 1% 10, Net 30 Net 30
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CITY OF MESQUITE
BID TABULATION

Title:
Bid No:
Date:

ITEM QTY UNIT    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED    UNIT EXTENDED
1 600 ea 2.85            1,710.00           No Bid 2.40           1,440.00           No Bid
2 6000 ea 2.50            15,000.00         3.07           18,420.00         2.60           15,600.00         No Bid
3 100 bund 24.50          2,450.00           No Bid 38.00         3,800.00           No Bid
4 500 bund 6.85            3,425.00           5.30           2,650.00           8.00           4,000.00           No Bid
5 300 bund 6.95            2,085.00           5.75           1,725.00           8.25           2,475.00           No Bid
6 10 bag 23.75          237.50              No Bid 27.00         270.00              No Bid
7 10 bag 26.50          265.00              No Bid 35.00         350.00              No Bid
8 15 bag 29.50          442.50              24.00         360.00              37.50         562.50              No Bid
9 500 ea 0.95            475.00              No Bid 2.50           1,250.00           No Bid

10 10 bag 16.50          165.00              11.50         115.00              25.00         250.00              No Bid
11 12 rl 31.50          378.00              42.00         504.00              55.00         660.00              No Bid
12 12 rl 23.50          282.00              No Bid 45.00         540.00              No Bid
13 7000 ea 4.35            30,450.00         5.40           37,800.00         5.50           38,500.00         No Bid

300.00              -                    -                    

GROSS TOTAL: 57,365.00$       61,574.00$       69,697.50$       No Bid
LESS DISCOUNT: (573.65)             (3,484.88)          
NET TOTAL: 56,791.35$       61,574.00$       66,212.62$       
TERMS:
DELIVERY:

Net 30 5% 10, Net 30
5 Calendar Days Not Stated 1 - 2 Calendar Days
1% 10, Net 30

Craddock Lumber Company Associated Truss & Lumber Kori's Rebar & Supplies
Valley Rubber & Gasket 

Company

Minimum dollar amount per order

225 each 3-1/4" Plastic Chairs for Rebar
5,000 each 4-1/2" Tie Wire for Rebar
5,000 each 5-1/2" Tie Wire for Rebar
3/4" x 6" x 7" Curb Ear Flexcell Expansion Joint
500 each 2-1/4" Plastic Chairs for Rebar
Black Poly, 4 Mil 20' x 100'
Black Poly, 4 Mil 10' x 100'
1/2" x 20' Number 4 Grade 40 Steel Rebar

DESCRIPTION
1/2" x 4" x 10' Flexcell Expansion Joint

50 each 1" x 2" x 24" Wood Stakes

Annual Supply of Construction Materials
2010-007

50 each 1" x 2" x 18" Wood Stakes

October 1, 2009 2:00 p.m.

3/8" x 20' Number 3 Grade 40 Steel Rebar
50 each 1" x 2" x 48" Wood Stakes
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